STATE OF MICHIGAN

COUNTY OF EATON ROLL CALL AND VOTES IN BOARD OF COMMISSIONER'S

()r\\,
)

ROLL CALL

SESSION A.D. 2012

ON MOTION TO

ON MOTION TO

ON MOTION TO

A.M. [P COMMISSIONERS

AYE NAY

AYE NAY

AYE NAY

MICHAEL HOSEY

BLAKE MULDER

SUSAN HOFFMAN

LARRY BRUNETTE

JAMES OSIECZONEK

JOHN BOLES

GLENN H. FREEMAN III

JOSEPH C. BREHLER

ROGER EAKIN

WAYNE RIDGE

L. DARYL BAKER

DALE BARR

JEREMY WHITTUM

BEN COLESTOCK

SUS S S SIS SRS S R E

JOHN FORELL




EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

APRIL 18, 2012

The Eaton County Board of Commissioners met in regular session at the County Facilities, in the
City of Charlotte, Wednesday, April 18, 2012.

Chairman Forell called the meeting to order at 7:00 PM.
The Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag was given by all.
Commissioner Eakin gave the invocation.

Roll call. Commissioners present; Michael Hosey, Blake Mulder, Susan Hoffman, Larry Brunette,
James Osieczonek, John Boles, Glenn Freeman, Joseph Brehler, Roger Eakin, Wayne Ridge, L. Daryl
Baker, Dale Barr, Jeremy Whittum, Ben Colestock, John Forell. Commissioners absent; None.

Chairman Forell asked for additions or corrections to the agenda. ‘
(
Commissioner Barr moved the agenda be approved as presented. Seconded by Commissioner
Hosey. Carried.

Commissioner Baker moved the minutes of March 21, 2012 be approved és presented. Seconded
by Commissioner Ridge. Carried.

Communications. Controller Fuentes reported the Drain Commissioner’s annual report was
emailed to all.

Honorable District Court Judge Harvey Hoffman presented four graduates from the District Court
Specialty Court Graduation program with a plaque commemorating their graduation from the fast
track program. Each graduate spoke about their journey leading up to partlclpatlon in the program
and how their lives have changed while involved with the program. .

Commissioner Hoffman moved the approval of Resolution #12-4-29 to Recognize April 2012 as
National Alcohol Awareness Month.
WHEREAS, excessive alcohol use, including binge and underage drinking, is the third leading cause
of preventable death in the United States; and
WHEREAS, this dangerous behavior is responsible for more than 79,000 deaths annually and a wide
range of health and social problems; and
WHEREAS, excessive alcohol use costs the U.S. approximately $185 billion each year in health care
and criminal Justlce expenses, as well as lost worker productivity; and
WHEREAS, excessive alcohol use takes an enormous toll on individuals, families, and communities;
and
WHEREAS, the stlgma attached to excessive alcohol use has kept a significant number of residents
from seeking treatment; and
WHEREAS, resources exist online and in our community, w1111ng, ready and able to provide
education, prevention, treatment and recovery supports to help change and redirect lives; and
WHEREAS, to help achieve this goal of reducing binge and excessive alcohol consumption, The U.S.
Department of Human Services, the Substance Abuse and Mental Health Administration, Recovery
Network Inc. Eaton Behavioral Health and the Eaton County Substance Abuse Advisory Group invite
all residents of Eaton County to participate in National Alcohol Awareness Month (April 2012)
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Eaton County Board of Commissioners does herby
proclaim the month of April 2012 National Alcohol Awareness Month; and
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Eaton County Board of Commissioners calls upon the citizens
of Eaton County to observe this month with appropriate prevention programs and recovery activities.
Seconded by Commissioner Mulder. Carried.




Public Comment. Chief Judge Thomas Byerley spoke about courthouse security. He urged the
Board to restore a Sheriff Deputy in the courthouse for security purposes and spoke against the
purchase of security cameras because of their lack of cost effectiveness, as presented in a resolution
to be voted on later tonight. ' v

Commissioner Baker moved to approve the appointment of Jerry Roe to the Parks and Recreation
Commissioner for the remainder of an unexpired term, expiring December 31, 2013. Seconded by
Commissioner Whittum. Carried.

Commissioner Baker moved the approval of Resolution #12-4-30 to Approve DCA 3-12-1.
WHEREAS, Eaton County Planning Commission initiated a petition for a Comprehensive Amendment
to the Eaton County Land Development Code (zoning ordinance) to clarify the intent, update
language and improve comprehension. Amendments are proposed to the following: Article 6 General
Provisions (amend Section 6.5.4), Article 7 Land Development Districts (amend Section 7.5A.3) &
Article 14 Specific Provisions and Requirements (amend Sections 14.25.5 A, 14.28.2 1 & 14.37.2);
and '

WHEREAS, the Eaton County Planning Commission held a duly advertised and noticed public
hearing on March 6, 2012; and

WHEREAS, the Eaton County Planning Commission found the requested amendment to be
consistent with the required findings of fact (Items A-G) contained in Section 13.6 of the Eaton
County Land Development Code; and

WHEREAS, the Eaton County Planning Commission has taken action on March 6, 2012 to
recommend the approval of the request for a comprehensive amendment to the Eaton County Land
Development Code (zoning ordinance) to clarify the intent, update language and improve
comprehension. Amendments are proposed to the following: Article 6 General Provisions (amend
Section 6.5.4), Article 7 Land Development Districts (amend Section 7.5A.3) & Article 14 Specific
Provisions and Requirements (amend Sections 14.25.5 A, 14.28.2 1 & 14.37.2).

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Commissioners of the County of Eaton,
Michigan having considered the findings of facts and recommendations hereby:

APPROVES the request by Eaton County Planning Commission for a Comprehensive Amendment to
the Eaton County Land Development Code (zoning ordinance) to clarify the intent, update language
and improve comprehension. Amendments are proposed to the following: Article 6 General
Provisions (amend Section 6.5.4), Article 7 Land Development Districts (amend Section 7.5A.3) &
Article 14 Specific Provisions and Requirements (amend Sections 14.25.5 A, 14.28.2 1 & 14.37.2).
Seconded by Commissioner Whittum. Carried. ‘

Commissioner Baker moved the approval of an Ordinance to Amend the 2008 Michigan Electric
Code, as amended, to provide for violations of said ordinance to be municipal civil infractions; to
designate authorized local officials responsible to enforce municipal civil infraction violations of the
2008 Michigan Electric Code; to place the Violations Bureau at the Department of Construction
Codes; to adopt a savings clause; to provide an effective date and to add a new article 80.27 municipal
civil infraction. Seconded by Commissioner Eakin. Carried. (copy on file)

Commissioner Baker moved the approval of an Ordinance to Amend the 2009 Michigan Building
Code, as amended, to provide for violations of said ordinance to be municipal civil infractions; to designate
authorized local officials responsible to enforce municipal civil infraction violations of the 2009 Michigan
Building Code; to place the Violations Bureau at the Department of Construction Codes; to adopt a savings
clause; to provide an effective date and to add a new subsection 114.3 violation penalties. Seconded by
Commissioner Hosey. Carried. (copy on file)

Commissioner Baker moved the approval of an Ordinance to Amend the 2009 Michigan
Mechanical Code, as amended, to provide for violations of said ordinance to be municipal civil
infractions; to designate authorized local officials responsible to enforce municipal civil infraction
violations of the 2009 Michigan Mechanical Code; to place the Violations Bureau at the Department
of Construction Codes; to adopt a savings clause, to provide an effective date and to add a new
subsection 108.8 violation penalties. Seconded by Commissioner Brunette. Carried. (copy on file)

Commissioner Baker moved the approval of an Ordinance to Amend the 2009 Michigan Plumbing
Code, as amended, to provide for violations of said ordinance to be municipal civil infractions; to

2




designate authorized local officials responsible to enforce municipal civil infraction violations of the
2009 Michigan Plumbing Code; to place the Violations Bureau at the Department of Construction
Codes; to adopt a savings clause, to provide an effective date and to add a new subsection 108.8
violation penalties. Seconded by Commissioner Hosey. Carried. (copy on file)

Commissioner Baker moved the approval of an Ordinance to Amend the 2009 Michigan
Residential Code, as amended, to provide for violations of said ordinance to be municipal civil
infractions; to designate authorized local officials responsible to enforce municipal civil infraction
violations of the 2009 Michigan Residential Code; to place the Violations Bureau at the Department
of Construction Codes; to adopt a savings clause, to provide an effective date and to add a new

_subsection R113.5 violation penalties. Seconded by Commissioner Eakin. Carried. (copy on file)

Commissioner Baker moved the approval of an Ordinance to Amend the 2009 Michigan
Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings, as amended, to provide for violations of said ordinance to
be municipal civil infractions; to designate authorized local officials responsible to enforce municipal
civil infraction violations of the 2009 Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings; to place
the Violations Bureau at the Department of Construction Codes; to adopt a savings clause, to provide
an effective date and to add a new subsection 113.5 violation penalties. Seconded by Commissioner
Ridge. Carried. (copy on file)

Commissioner Baker moved the approval of an Ordinance to Amend the 2009 International
Property Maintenance Code, as amended, to provide for violations of said ordinance to be municipal
civil infractions; to designate authorized local officials responsible to enforce municipal civil
infraction violations of the 2009 International Property Maintenance Code; to place the Violations
Bureau at the Department of Construction Codes; to adopt a savings clause, to provide an effective

‘date and to add a new subsection 106.6 violation penalties. Seconded by Commissioner Whittum.
Carried. (copy on file) ‘

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of Resolution #12-4-31 to Adopt the 2012 Equalized
Valuations for Eaton County. Equalization Director Tim Vandermark spoke about the report.
Seconded by Commissioner Hosey. Carried. (Copy of file)

Commissioneér Mulder moved the approval of Resolution #12-4-32 to submit to a vote of the
electorate to renew the millage for Comprehensive Emergency Telephone Services (911 Services)
WHEREAS, Eaton County desires to continue to operate and maintain county-wide emergency
telephone and dispatch services for the benefit of the citizens of the County; and
WHEREAS, 911 emergency telephone and dispatch services are of substantial benefit to the citizens
of the County. '
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the following question be submitted to a vote of the
electorate of Eaton County at the primary election to be held August 7, 2012.

9-1-1 AND CENTRAL DISPATCH

MILLAGE RENEWAL QUESTION
For the purpose of continuing funding for a comprehensive, Countywide Enhanced 9-1-1 Emergency
Telephone and Central Dispatch System, shall the constitutional limitation upon the total amount of
taxes which may be assessed in one (1) year upon all taxable real and tangible personal property
within the County of Eaton, Michigan, be increased in an amount not to exceed 0.95 mill ($0.95 on
each $1,000 of taxable value) for a period of five (5) years (2014-2018) inclusive and shall the County
levy such millage for said purposes? If approved and levied in its entirety, this millage would raise an
estimated $3,154,049 in 2014 to be distributed to the countywide 9-1-1 and Central Dispatch
System as provided in the Eaton County 9-1-1 Service Plan. A small portion of the revenue collected
(approximately $47,311 in 2014) may be required to be distributed to Downtown Development
Authorities, Tax Increment Financing Authorities, Local Development Financing Authorities and
Brownfield Redevelopment Financing Authorities established in the cities of Charlotte, Eaton Rapids,
Grand Ledge, Potterville and Olivet.
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that this question is hereby certified to the County Clerk; and
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the County Clerk is hereby directed to cause this proposed
question to be stated on the August 7, 2012 ballot and to be prepared and distributed in the manner
required by law. Seconded by Commissioner Hosey. Carried.

3




Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of Resolution #12-4-33 to submit to a vote of the
electorate to renew the Juvenile Millage.
WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners desires to continue funding to detain and house delinquent
juveniles and protective services for abused and neglected children and to continue and improve
prevention and treatment programs for such juveniles and children; and
WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners wants to provide financial stability necessary for sound
planning through a continuation millage.
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the following question be submitted to a vote of the
electorate of Eaton County in the primary election to be held August 7, 2012.

JUVENILE MILLAGE AUTHORIZATION QUESTION

Shall the previously voted increase in the tax limitation and levy imposed under the Michigan
Constitution by the County of Eaton be renewed in an amount not to exceed 0.35 mill ($0.35 on each
$1,000 dollars of taxable value) against all taxable real and tangible personal property within the
County of Eaton for a period of (5) five years, 2014 to 2018, inclusive, for the purposes of continued
funding of detaining and housing Eaton County juveniles who are delinquent, to provide protective
services for abused and neglected children, and to operate new and existing prevention and
treatment programs for such juveniles and children? If approved and levied in full, this millage will
raise an estimated $1,162,018 for juvenile housing and programs during the first calendar year of
the levy based on taxable value. A small portion of the revenue collected (approximately $18,011 in
2014) may be required to be distributed to Downtown Development Authorities, Tax Increment
Financing Authorities, Local Development Financing Authorities and Brownfield Redevelopment
Financing Authorities established in the cities of Charlotte, Eaton Rapids, Grand Ledge, Potterville
and Olivet.
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that this question is hereby certified to the County Clerk; and
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the County Clerk is hereby directed to cause this proposed
question to be stated on the August 7, 2012 ballot and to be prepared and distributed in the manner
required by law. Seconded by Commissioner Baker. Carried.

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of Resolution #12-4-34 to authorize application for
United Way Grant Application.
WHEREAS, the Eaton County United Way has grant funds avallable through an inter-agency
agreement with the United Way; and
WHEREAS, the Day Treatment Program is requesting approval to apply for a grant to develop the
Literacy Improves Future Earnings (L.I.F.E) Program; and
WHEREAS, the grant would provide funding to hire contractual Literacy Teachers who will focus on
improving student reading and comprehension skills through securing literacy materials,
determining deficiencies and program eligibility, meeting with students bi-weekly and working with
Youth Facility Workers to support literacy efforts of the program; and
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Commissioners authorize the Circuit Court
- Day Treatment Program to submit a grant application in an amount not to exceed $20,000 for the
period of October 1, 2012 to September 30, 2013 requiring no matching funds; and
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that if the County’s participation in the grant is discontinued or
requires a County General Fund contribution, the continuation of the grant funded positions will be
reviewed by the appropnate committees to determine the nece381ty of General Fund commitment;
and
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Controller be authorized to approve any necessary budget
amendments to increase expenditures and increase grant revenue if the grant is approved by Eaton
County United Way; and
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Chairperson of the Board of Commissioners be authorized to
sign any necessary documents. Seconded by Commissioner Baker. Carried.

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of Resolution #12-4-35 to Approve Title IV-D
Cooperative Reimbursement Grant Applications.
WHEREAS, the Friend of the Court and Prosecuting Attorney have participated in the Title IV-D
Cooperative Reimbursement Program with the State of Michigan Department of Human Services in
previous years; and, '
WHEREAS, the grant applications for the 2012/2013 fiscal year are being prepared in an amount not
to exceed $1,600,000 for the Friend of the Court and $150,000 for the Prosecuting Attorney.
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that

4




1. The Department of Human Services Title IV-D Cooperative Reimbursement grant applications are
authorized; and ‘

2. The Chairperson of the County Board of Commissioners is hereby authorized to execute said
agreements on behalf of the County Board of Commissioners upon approval by the State. Seconded
by Commissioner Barr. Carried.

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of Resolution #12-4-36 to approve 2011/2012 Budget

Amendments.

WHEREAS, the Eaton County 2011/2012 Appropriations Act of September 21, 2011 states that any
amendment to increase a salary and/or a Capital Outlay line-item in excess of $2,500.00 or any
amendment to increase the total budget of any fund or department in excess of $2,500.00 shall be
amended by the Board of Commissioners, except that any amendment to decrease the General Fund
Contingency shall be approved by the Board of Commissioners; and
WHEREAS, such amendments are needed in order to comply with the Uniform Budgeting and
Accounting Act of 1978, P.A. 621.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the followmg budget amendments be approved and
added to the 2011/2012 Eaton County Budget:

GENERAL FUND

COUNTY CLERK - 215
Increase , Wage and Fringe ~$ 9,500
Decrease Contingency $ 9,500

Seconded by Commissioner Ridge. Carried.

Commissioner Mulder moved to approve 2011/2012 General Fund Budget Amendments

_SHERIFF - 301
Increase : ‘Wage and Fringe $ 27,780
Decrease Contingency $ 27,780

To increase budget for the cost of an entry level deputy for courthouse security as recommended by
the Public Safety Committee.

Commissioners Brehler, Mulder, Boles and Hosey spoke about the addition of a deputy for
courthouse security.

Seconded by Commissioner Boles. Carried. Nays: Commissioners Brehler and Eakin.

SPECIAL REVENUE FUND ’

Commissioner Mulder moved to approve 2011/2012 Special Revenue Fund Budget Amendments.

CONSTRUCTION CODE - 240

Increase Wage and Fringe : $ 5,900
Increase Fund Balance Carryover $ 5,900
To increase budget for the electrical inspector to increase from 32 to 40 hours per week as
recommended by the Public Works and Planning Committee. Seconded by Commissioner Ridge.
Carried. »

Commissioner Mulder moved to approve 2011/2012 Special Revenue Fund Budget Amendments.
PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT - 245
Increase Capital Equipment $ 15,000
Increase Fund Balance Carryover $ 15,000
To increase budget for additional security cameras in the courthouse building. Seconded by
Commissioner Boles.

Commissioners Boles, Whittum, Baker, Brehler, Hoffman, Brunette, Mulder and Freeman spoke
about the addition of security cameras in the courthouse.

Commissioner Boles moved to amend the original motion and to refer the request for security
cameras back to the Public Safety Committee for further review and remove the Special Revenue
Budget Amendment request. Seconded by Commissioner Osieczonek. Carried. Nays; Hosey,
Brehler.

Vote on original motion as amended. Carrled Nays; Hosey, Brehler.

Commissioner Mulder moved to approve 2011/2012 Special Revenue Fund Budget Amendments.
' COMPUTER FUND - 298 ‘
Increase Wage and Fringe $ 11,100

5




Increase Computer Services Revenue’ $ 11,100
To increase budget for use of interns in Information Systems. Seconded by Commissioner Baker.
Carried.

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of claims as audited by the Ways and Means Committee
in the amount of $500,634.39 and to accept the report of previously authorized payments. Seconded
by Commissioner Ridge. Carried.

There was no Public Comment.

Commissioner Comment. Commissioner Osieczonek thanked the Drain Commissioner for his
continued efforts in limiting new drain petitions this year. The Burrell Drain is an Intercounty Drain
with severe problems and he was pleased that the Drain Commissioner corrected those issues.

Commissioner Freeman announced a rubberized baseball field is being built in Dewitt called
Miracle Field and is for children with disabilities. The Union is helping to build it and Commissioner
Freeman invited anyone interested to Dewitt to see the field. ‘

Commissioner Hosey announced that the last week in April is the Vermontville Maple Syrup
Festival.

There was no Unfinished Business or Old Business.

New Business.

County Clerk and Register of Deeds Fran Fuller announced she would be retiring at the end of
this year.

Commissioners were reminded of the Strategic Workshop meeting tomorrow beginning at 8:30 AM
at Delta Township LCC West campus.

Commissioner Hosey moved the meeting adjourn to Wednesday, May 16, 2012 at 7:00 PM.
Seconded by Commissioner Eakin. Carried.

Yln B-Onell) 0 vamea-illl

glairman of the Board of Commissioners Clerk of the Board of Commissioners




‘ #12-4-29
EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS |
April 18,2012
RESOLUTION TO RECOGNIZE APRIL 2012

as NATIONAL ALCOHOL AWARENESS MONTH

Commissioner Hoffman moved the approval of the followihg resolution. Seconded by
Commissioner Mulder. '

WHEREAS, excessive alcohol use, including binge and underage drinking, is the third leading
cause of preventable death in the United States; and

WHEREAS, this dangerous behavior is responsible for more than 79,000 deaths annually and a
wide range of health and social problems; and

WHEREAS, excessive alcohol use costs the U.S. approximately $185 billion each year in health
care and criminal justice expenses, as well as lost worker productivity; and ‘

WHEREAS, excessive alcohol use takes an enormous toll on individuals, families, and

communities; and

WHEREAS, the stigma attached to excessive alcohol use has kept a significant number of
residents from seeking treatment; and '

WHEREAS, resources exist online and in our community, willing, ready and able to provide
education, prevention, treatment and recovery supports to help change and redirect lives; and

WHEREAS, to help achieve this goal of reducing binge and excessive alcohol consumption,
The U.S. Department of Human Services, the Substance Abuse and Mental Health
Administration, Recovery Network Inc. Eaton Behavioral Health and the Eaton County
Substance Abuse Advisory Group invite all residents of Eaton County to participate in National
Alcohol Awareness Month (April 2012)

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Eaton County Board of Commissioners
does herby proclaim the month of April 2012 National Alcohol Awareness Month; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Eaton County Board of Commissioners calls upon the
citizens of Eaton County to observe this month with appropriate prevention programs and
recovery activities. Carried. ’

/




#12-4-30

EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
v Aprll 18 2012
RESOLUTION TO APPROVE DCA-3-1_2-1

lntroduced by the Public Works and Planning Commiittee
€onuussmner ‘Baker moved the approval of the following resolution. -Seconded by
Commissioner Whittum.
PREAMBLE: The Eaton County Land Development Code, an Ordmance adopted by the
Commissioners of the County. of Eaton pursuant to Public- Act 183 of 1943, and administered
pursuant to Public Act 110 of 2006, may be amended from tlme to t|me by followmg procedures'
-outlined in Artlcle 13 of the Development Code.

. ,WHEREAS Eaton County Planning Commlssmn lnltlated a petrtlon for a Comprehensnve
Amendment to the Eaton County Land Development Code (zoning ordmance) to clarify the
intent, update language and improve comprehension. Amendments are proposed to the

- followmg Article 6 General Provisions (amend Section 6.5.4), Article 7 Land Development
Districts (amend Section 7.5A.3) & Article 14 Specnf ¢ Provisions -and Requurements (amend

- Sections 14. 255A 14. 282!& 14. 37.2); and : :

. WHEREAS, the Eaton County Planmng Commrssron held a duly advertised and notlced ‘public
" hearing on March 6, 2012 and : . S _ :

WHEREAS the Eaton County Plannlng Commlssmn found the requested amendment to be |
consistent with the required findings of fact (ltems A-G) contamed in Sectlon 13.6 of the ‘Eaton

County Land. Development Code and

WHEREAS; the. Eaton County Planmng Commission has taken action on March 6, 2012 to

recommend the approval of the request for a comprehensive amendment to the Eaton County

Land Development Code (zoning ordinance) to clarify the intent, update language and improve

comprehensuon Amendments are proposed to the following: ~Article 6 General Provisions

(amend. Section 6.5.4), Article 7 Land Development Districts (amend Sectlon 7.5A.3) & Article
- 14 Specific Provisions and Requwements (amend Sectlons 14.25.5 A, 14.28. 2 | & 14.37.2).

- NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Commrssroners of the County of.
Eaton, Michigan havrng considered the fi ndrngs of facts and recommendatlons hereby:

_.APPROVES the request by Eaton County Plannlng Commrssron for. a Comprehensive
Amendment to the Eaton County Land Development Code (zoning ordinance) to clarify the =
intent, update language and improve comprehension. - Amendments are proposed to the
following: Article 6 General Provisions (amend Section 6.5.4), Article 7 Land Development
Districts (amend Section 7.5A. 3) & ‘Article 14 Specrf c Provisions and Requrrements (amend
Sections 14.25.5 A, 14. 28 21&14.37. 2)




~ Motion carried.

N

Atthe regular meetlng of the Eaton County Board of Commlssroners on Abrll 18, 2012 the " -

“Resolution regardlng the approval of said request was adopted

.i Those votlng Aye: Hosey, Mulder, Hoffman, Brunette, 081eczonek Boles Freeman,

. Brehler, Eakin, Rldge, Baker, Barr, Whlttum, Colestock, Forell.

Those voting 'N'éy:_' - None
Abst'e'ntlon:i' _ ~~ None
Absent: .~ © None -~ - S

_John/orell, Chalrman o ,
Eaton County Board of Commlssroners

- l hereby certify- that the above Ordmance amendmg the Eaton County Land Development Code,

which was approved, is a true and correct copy-of that recorded in‘the ofﬁclal mlnutes of Apnl

. 18 2012 of the Eaton County Board of Commrssroners

M Frances Fuller Clerk
Eaton County Board ‘of Commlssmners




EATON COUNTY LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE

ZONING ORDINANCE AMENDMENT DCA-3-121

District Change Amendment DCA-3-12-1 to amend the Land Development Code (Zonmg
Ordinance) of Eaton County, as enacted in 1981 pursuant to the provrsrons of Public Act
110 of 2006, as amended

~An apphcatlon for a District Change Amendment for a Comprehensive Amendment to the Eaton

County Land Development Code (zoning ordinance) to clarify the intent, update language and
improve comprehension. Amendments are proposed to the following: Article 6 General
Provisions (amend Section 6.5.4), Article 7 Land Development Districts (amend Sectlon 7.5A.3)
- & ‘Article 14 Specific Prowsrons and Requrrements (amend Sections 14.25.5 A’ 14, 282 1 &
14.37.2).

WHEREAS -the Eaton County Plannmg Commlssron held a duIy advemsed and noticed publlc '
hearing on March 6, 2012; and :

WHEREAS the Eaton County Plannlng Commission has taken actlon on March 6, 2012 to |
recommend approval of the text amendment ,

WHEREAS “after careful consideration of the amendment the Eaton County Board of
Commissioners approved the aforementloned text amendment as follows:

Yeas_ 15

~ Nays 0
Abstaining___ 0
Absent

LM Franoes'Futler Clerk for the County of Eaton, do hereby certify that the' above and -

. foregoing is a true copy of the amendment to the Eaton County Land Development Code -

(Zoning Ordinance), as amended and passed by the Eaton County Board of Commrssroners on
April 18 2012, and now on record in the office of the Clerk of said County. -

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF | have set my hand and affixed the seal of said County at the City
of Charlotte, Mrchlgan the

. /X — 0 - dayof A, 2012 v , 3 S
M. Frances Fuller, Clerk ' JohnForell, Chairman

Eaton County Board of Commissioners Eaton County Board of Commrssroners




DCA-3 12-1 PROPOSED TEXT AMENDMENT »
" TO THE EATON COUNTY LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE
Add|t|ons shown m bold italic print and deletlons are shown by strikeout-print.

" The followmg District. Change Amendment, DCA-3-12-1, is proposed to the Eaton County Land
Development Code (Zoning Ordinance) to clarrfy its intent and to improve its. comprehensron The
: proposed amendments are as follows:

Article 6, General Provrslons, Sectlon 6.5 Temporarv Housmg Perrnlts

1. Add Ianguage for storage containers in Subsectlon 6 5.4 Temporary Burldmgs to ensure they are
removed from the property ina timely manner.

SECTION 6 5 TEMPORARY HOUSING PERMITS

‘No building or. structure hereafter. erected or moved upon a lot, and which does not meet the =
" requirements of this Ordinance, shall be used or occupied as a dwelling. No garage, barn, or

 accessory buildings; travel trailer, motor home, or cellar, whether fixed or portable, shall be used or

- occupied as a dwelling for a period of time greater than thirty (30) consecutive days within a one (1)
.year period. The Land Development Code Official may issue temporary housmg permlts subject to the
followmg procedures and limitations: : , .

V6 5.4  Temporary. Bunldlnqs & Storgge Contamers Moblle offices, tool sheds storage trallers- and ,
‘storage containers shall be permitted during the time of actual constructlon provided they are
located pursuant to Section 6.2.10 of this Ordinance, and are in“compliance with the Barry-
- Eaton District Health Department Sanitary Code. Said structures and storage containers shall
" be ‘removed within -twelve (12) working days after the completlon or- abandonment of
constructron ‘work on the property . .

~

Article 7, Land Develogment Districts & Artlcle 14, Sectlon 14.37 Li ght“ Au‘to‘mot.‘iVe,' Small Ehgine -
o Regalr & Automotlve Body Shop. R S I

1. Artlcle 7 Land Development Dlstrrcts Add Lrght Automotrve -Small Engme Reparr & Automotrve

.~ Body Shop as a use allowed with Site Plan Approval in a Local Business District (C-1). :

. 2. Article 14.37 Light Automotive, Small Engrne Repair & Automotive Body Shop: Add |anguage to
- 14 37 exemptmg busrnesses operating in-a Local Busrness Drstnct (C—1) from rtems A, B F. & i.

Section 7 5A.3 Local Busrness Dlstrrct -Uses Permltted by Slte Plan Approval Pursuant to Artrcle 8 of

this Ordinance:
: A.  Commercial Recreation Facrllty as defined in Article 5 of this Ordlnance

B. "Educatlonal Institutional, including publlc and prrvate schools as provnded in Section
. 14.10 of this Ordinance.

Financial Institution as defined in Amcle 5 of this Ordrnance with drive through service.
Funeral Home and Mortuary as defined in Article 5 of this Ordlnance
Office Building as defined in An‘lcle 5 of this Ordinance. '

Radio, Television and. Communication Towers as prowded in Subsectron 14 27.4 of this”
Ordrnance : _

G. , Restaurants as defi ned in Artrcle 5 of this Ordrnance xcludlng those with drlve through
' - service.

Mmoo




DCA-3-12-1 (EATON COUNTY TEXT AMENDMENT)
March 6, 2012

H. = Foster Care Facrlrty as provrded in Section 14. 4 of this Ordlnance
. Veterinary Hospital, Clinic, and Kennel as prowded in Section 14.1 of this Ordlnance

J. -~ Light Automotive, Small Engine Reparr & Automotive Body Shop as provrded in
Section 14.37 of this Ordmance ' v

‘ ‘, 4. K. 'Uses similar to the uses herein permltted by Slte Plan Approval. "

SECTION 14.37 LIGHT AUTOMOTIVE, SMALL ENGINE REPAIR & AUTOMOTIVE BODY SHOP:

14.37.1 Definition: An establlshment pnmanly engaged in the’ reparr or mamtenance of passenger
automoblles motorcycles, Irght duty trucks and small engines. ‘

A. Light Automotlve Includes passenger Automobiles, Motorcycles and Light Duty Trucks
. Vehicles which do not exceed 9,000 pounds gross weight. Work performed is limited to the
. replacement of any part that does not require removal of the engine, engine transmission or
differential. ‘May include repairs and replacement of cooling, electrical, fuel, oil and-exhaust -
" systems, brake adjustments, relining and repalrs wheel alrgnment and balancmg and repalr and
replacement of shock absorbers. .- - 4 : '

- B. Small Engines: Lawnmowers tractors all terraln vehicles (ATV) off road vehlcles (ORV) boats_
- jet skis, dirt bikes, mopeds and snowmoblles ,

- C. Automotrve Body Shop: A fac1l|ty which provrdes colllsron reparr serwces including body frame

stralghtenrng, replacement of damaged parts and parntlng or. undercoatrng of vehicles which do
-not exceed 9 000 pounds gross welght

14. 37 2 Regulatrons and Condrtlons

A The business shall conform to the requrrements of Section 14 13 Home Business. Any
~requirements.in thls section which are more: restrlctrve than 14. 13 shall be foIIowed

B. The licensed mechanlc shall be the property owner and resrde in the home located on the
property. . - y B , S - . :
- C. Facility where work is.being performed must be- Ilcensed by the State of Mlchlgan The lrcense
shall be submltted to.the Communrty Development Department annually.

" D. The Mechanic performing work shall be licensed by the State of Michigan. The lrcense shall be
- submitted to the Community Development Department prror to submlttlng a Condrtlonal Use
 Permit Applrcatlon and annually if approved.. : . _

E. The business shall have a contract with a licensed waste hauler to remove all fuel, orls solvents

and coolant from the property. Personal disposal is prohibited. A copy of the signed contract
from the hauler shall be submitted to the Community Development Department annually.

F. Only the property owner which is lrcensed by the. State of Mrchrgan and one (1) employee shall
- performwork. ,
G. There shall.be no outdoor storage of vehlcles or matenals assocrated with operation of the
business outside of busmess hours. All work performed on vehicles shall be done msrde the
- licensed facrllty . . .

| H. Hours of operatron are limited to Monday through Fnday 7: 00 a.m. to 6 00 p. m. and Saturday
8:00 a.m. to 12:00 p.m. - ,

-

Page - 2




DCA-3-12-1 (EATON COUNTY TEXT AMENDMENT)
March 6, 2012

I.. There shall be no sale of parts or fuels whlch are not assocrated with the repalr or body work of

a vehicle or small engine.

B J Small engrne repair busmesses are exempt from |tems CandDand the lrcensrng requirement

of item F.

K. All palnts used for the business shall-be water compllant
L. Automotive body shops shall be setback a one-hundred (100) feet from all property lines and

the road right-of-way. -

M.Automotive body shops shall be in compllance wrth all applicable regulatlons of the Umted

‘States Environmental Protection Agency -and-Michigan Department of Environmental Quality
and shall submrt documentatlon of compliance to the Commumty Development Department

annually.

'N. Automotive body. shops shall have a safety |nspect|on done by the: local f' ire department or
" county -building official on an annual basis. A copy of their findings shall be submrtted to the.

Community Development Department on an annual basis.

0. Businesses operated-in the Local Busmess Zoning Dlstrlct (C-1) are exempt from the

_requirements of ltemsA B., F &I

Article 14, Specific Provislons and Regl_xirementS'

1.

14.25 Surface Mrnes lnclude Ianguage for excavatlon setbacks from exrstlng structures in-

subsection 14.25.5 A.

2.

14.28 Private Roads: Subsectlon 14 28 2 | Preexustmg Roads Change the date for the
extension of preexrstrng private roads to February 4, 2008. Significant changes were made to.

the Private Road requiréments that became effective on February 4, 2008, Therefore any road
_created before that date should be upgraded if it’is extended. Also changes are being

recommended to clarify the intent ‘'of a new ot to be the creation of an additional parcel in order
.to-allow for lot Ime adjustments wrthout havmg to upgrade the prlvate road.

. SECTION 14 25 SURFACE MINING

14.25.1

14252

14.25.3

Defi nltlon A surface mine is a parcel of land utllrzed for the removal or extractron of natural

_mineral deposrts soil, and organic soils by open Ppit-mining methods

Excavation of Soils and Minerals: The . .excavation of peat, mulch sand gravel clay,
limestone, shale, or other natural mmeral deposrts shall be permltted only upon the |ssuance
of a Conditional Use Permit. : : ,

General Site Plan Requrrements ln addition to the regular' appllcatron for a Conditional Use
Permit and payment of fees, the appllcatlon shall be accompanied by a General Site Plan.

" The plan. shall be drawn to a scale of 1" 100' and said plan shall lnclude the following

information: .
A. ‘Name and address of owner(s) of land which removal will take place.

B. 'Name address and telephone number of person firm, or corporatlon who erI be
" . conducting the actual removal operation. . ‘

c. Location, size and legal description of the total site area to be mined.
D. A plan for extractron and’ reclamatlon for the total prolect whrch shall mclude

Page - 3




DCA—3-12 1 (EATON COUNTY TEXT AMENDMENT)
March 6, 2012 o

1. Surface overburden and topsorl stnpplng and stockpllrng plans

2. Provisions for gradmg, re-vegetation, and stabilization that will minimize soil
erosion, sedlmentatlon and publlc safety problems. A

" E. Surface water drainage provusrons and outlets
F.: The location and size of any. structures :

14 254 Rehabllltatlon All extraction areas shall be rehabilitated progressrvely as they are worked out.
Rehabilitated sites shall be reasonably natural and inconspicuous and shall be reasonably
lacking in hazard. All slopes and banks remaining above water level and below water level to

~a depth of five (5) feet shall be graded to angles which do not exceed one (1) foot in elevation . ..

‘ for each three (3) feet of horizontal surface and they shall.be treated to prevent erosmn or any )
other potentlal deterioration. - , A .

14 25 5 Site Development Requirements: .

A_ - Setbacks in which no part of the mmmg operatlon may take: place except for mgress
and egress shall be as follows: . _

1. Excavatron shall not take place wrthln fifty (50) feet from any structure

' + 2. [Excavation below-the existlng grade of adjacent roads or property lines shall not
: take. place within twenty-f ive (25) feet from any adjacent property Ilne or road
nght—of—way

: 2—3 No machinery will be erected or marntalned wrthln one. hundred “ 00) feet of any
RN property or road right-of-way line. . . o

B .."Fencmg If fencmg is deemed a- necessary requrrement of the Condltlonal Use Permlt
. the Ptannlng Commrssnon shall specrfy the type and location of the requured fencmg

C. “ Interior access roads, ° parklng lots haul road, loading and unloadlng areas and. :
- stockpiled materials shall be maintained so as to limit the nuisance caused by wmd
blown dust. ' : . . ,

L . “D.. Hours of operatlon shall be Monday through Fnday from 7. 00 a. m to 6:00 pm and )
R Saturdayfrom700am to1200pm v A

~ No hours of operation on Sundays or the followung holldays

- ~(1)’ " New Year's Day - January 1st -
o (2) Memorial Day — Last Monday of May
"(3) - Independence Day - July.4th o
“-(4)- . Labor Day - First Monday in September
(5 .Thanksglvmg Day - Fourth Thursday in November
“ .(6) -~ Christmas Day — December 25th

.E. - Failure to maintain all reqwred State or Federal licenses and/or to develop and maintain
a surface mining operation in accord-with the terms of the conditional use permlt may
result in the immediate revocation of said conditional use permlt and any and all other

- sanctions and/or penalties ava|lable to the County

SECTION 14.28 PRIVATE ROADS

: \.; :

g 14:28.1 Defmltlon A road servncmg two (2) or more Iots or ‘parcels which provrdes access to a
' publlc road.’ : :

14.28.2 Regulatlons and Condltlons - To obtain a permit, the applicant shall provide
documented proof of the followmg ' , ' :

Page -4




DCA-3-12-1 (EATON COUNTY TEXT AMENDMENT)

March 6, 2012
A

' B.

Plans: All plans for Priva_te' Roads which are extended or laid out for access to two (2) or
more lots, parcels, or principal buildings, must be reviewed and approved by the

‘Community Development Official. Following review, a permit must be issued by the

Community Development Official before construction may begin.

1. *Plans shall give dimensions and bearlngs of the road r|ght-of-way prepared by a
licensed surveyor. : : :

2. - The road way shall be shown within the rlght-of-way with road alignment and
profile grades. A chensed Professronal Engrneer shall . desrgn and seal the
plans. :

Malntenance Agreement A Mamtenance Agreement must bind the owners of all
affected lots and parcels whose primary access is provided by the Private Road,
including their successors and assigns. It must be recorded with the Eaton: County
Register of Deeds. It must be submitted to the Community Development . Official prior to

- issuance of a Private Road Permit. The Maintenance Agreement must mclude the -

following minimum information.

1. ‘Co-Owner Association: A provnsron for an mcorporated association of co-
owners along the proposed Private Road, which shall be responsible to collect
~ fees.and to build and maintain the Private Road or Roads.

2.  Restrictive Covenant. A restrictive covenant shall be mcluded in the - :

Maintenance ‘Agreement - establishing the responsibility for mamtarnlng ‘the
: anate Road on aII lots and parcels to be serviced by the anate Road. -

-3 'Fmancmg Feasrble and ‘practical method for ﬁnancmg the repalr and‘.

marntenance of the anate Road in complrance with this ordinance.

Prohlblted Nelther the respective Township nor the Eaton County Road Commrssron, L

shall be obligated to perform regular- inspections of the easement area or provide
necessary repairs or maintenance to the Private Road. ‘The Eaton County Community
Development Department is not responsrble for the Iegalrty or enforcement ‘of the

’ 4_ma|ntenance agreement.
- Minimum Road Standards: Al prrvate roads shall comply with the following constructlon

standards and. applicants for prrvate road approval shall obtam all required permrts pnor

‘to construction.

1. Easement: Shall be dedrcated in an amount between srxty-srx (66) and one K
7 ~hundred (100) feet wide. : : :
2. Driving surface: Shall be a minimum of erghteen (18) feet wide with two (2) foot ,

shoulders on both sides.

‘ 3. Materials: - The driving surface shall have a minimum of six (6) inches of 22A, »

Aggregate Surface over a minimum six (6) inch CL Il sand subbase over a
compacted base. Surface must be crowned six (6) inches (see figure 10). Sand
subbase and 22A aggregate must be compacted to 95% maximum dry density.
Certifications must be provided that the materials meet applicable MDOT
specification or test results provided by an approved soils laboratory. ‘

4. Drainage: A dralnage plan shall be submitted on a topographic map showmg

‘how surface drainage is being dispersed. Drainage and drainage calculations -

shall be approved by the Eaton County Drain Commissioner. If the Drain
Commissioner determinies ditching is required, the road shall be ditched on both
sides to prevent the accumulation of water upon the driving surface and

Page-5




DCA-3-12-1 (EATON COUNTY TEXT AMENDMENT)

March 6, 2012

shoulders. Ditches shall be a minimum of eighteen (18) inches below the edge |
of shoulder with 1 on 4 slopes and a one (1) foot bottom width.- Cross culverts

- shall have a minimum of twelve (12) inch cover. -Drainage in relationship to its
- impact on-a County Road shall also be approved by the Eaton County Road _

Commission. o
Ingress- and Egress: The end of the’ road shall have a cul-de-sac with a forty-

- eight (48) foot minimum outside radius (fifty (50) foot radius to edge of shoulder).
- “An optional island shall have a twenty (20) foot radius (larger if outside radius is

increased). The cul-de-sac shall have a sixty-five (65) foot mmlmum radlus

f ’vc1rcular easement (see fi igure: 11).

"NOtlflcatIOI'I A copy of this ordmance sugned by the lot owner, must be'.

‘presented to the Community Development Official before a Zonmg Referral
}Permlt will be issued for any lot along a Private Road. :

lnspectlon The prlvate road construction shall be mspected/under the dlrectlon ‘
of a Licensed. Professional Engineer. A letter from the -Licensed Professional

‘ Engmeer stating the completed project complies with approved plans and this -

Aordmance shall be provided to the Community Development Department.

Access to public roads: The access to public roads shall. be approved by the

Eaton County Road Commission or the Michigan Department. of Transportation -

(MDOT) depending on the roads jurisdiction. The intersection shall be desugned o
- in accordance with the Jurlsdlctlonal agency requurements :

-Figure 1'0_-»»' o

cn

G 7 " 2" SHOULDER

6° MDOT 224 ° .

. . . : ) . : o MNyomeH .
47 M. ToPsOL " IYPICAL CROSS SECTION o gortoM
: NDOT 7O SCALE : '

Road Name: Road name shall be approved by the Eaton County> Road Commission,
. the Tri-County Regional Planning Commission, ‘911 Central Dlspatch and the Eaton ‘
, County Commumty Development Department

Page -6




DCA-3-12-1 (EATON COUNTY TEXT AMENDMENT) -

March 6, 2012

Fo

[

Figure 11

TYPICAL 18 FOOT

ROADWAY W/ 2 =~ "‘
FOOT SHOULDERS .7 - \\

"GRASSED ISLAND IS >

OPTIONAL, BUT POSITIVE
DRAINAGE TO PERIMETER OF
CUL-DE-SAC 1S REQUIRED.

H.

. . . - SHOULDER
NOTE: CUL-DE-SAC RADIil .SHOWN ARE -

MINIMUMS.  IF (OUTSIDE RADIUS 1S

INCREASED, THE EASEMENT, RADlUS

MUST BE INCREASED AND THE

ISLAND RADIUS ADJUSTED TO -

ALLOW TRUCK TURNING MOVMENTS.

Slgnage The followmg sngnage must be provrded to receive a Private Road perrnlt

1. Road Name Sign: A type approved by the County Road Commission placed at

. the intersections of the Private Road and Public or Private Roads. The bottom of -
. the sign face shall be placed a mrmmum of six (6) feet above the adjacent road
“surface. : _ o o ‘

2., ‘“Private Road” Sign: Shall face the intersection along the Private Road, o'ne (1) |

* foot outside the public road right-of-way. The bottom of the sign face shall be

placed a minimum of five (5) feet above the adjacent road surface. The sign face -~

size shall'be twelve (12) to eighteen (18) lnches m w1dth and erghteen (18) to
btwenty-four (24) inches in helght

" Duration of Permit: Any’ permlt granted under thls ordmance shall explre two (2) years
“after it is granted, unless road construction is completed within that time. " Prior to its-
expiration, a permit may be renewed for additional terms of one (1) year by appllcatlon to
the Eaton County Community Development Department

Amendments ~Any additions, deletions, or alterations from the orlglnal recorded

. agreement or plans shall be recorded as amendments to the original at the Register of

Deeds office and submitted to the Communlty Development Official to determine '
compllance wrth thls ordinance. .

Preexisting Roads: Prior to the extension of eX|st|ng prrvate roads (those roads created -
. prior to 4/22/96 2/4/08) or the addition of one or more lots or a site condominium

development development-of new—orsubdividedlol{s); with access provided by the

~ Private Road, all portions of the road (existing and/or new) shall be improved to

meet the standards of thls Ordmance all-reqwrements—ef—thrs—erdmanee—must—be—met

Page-7




z6L'svL'ey 0 0 265'699°0€ 001°250'G 001°'220°L 0 ojjinueyod
€12'v92'9L 0 0 6¥6'590°2L 98¥'0ve 812'8G8' 0 19NIO
conmNnm 0 0 ,ooQonon 000'525°2L 00v'c28’'s 0 Buisue
o0oL‘e6e'L0z 0 0 00€'6ES° 2L oov'svl'e 00%'50.2'0S 0 abpa pueso
058'01L8'LLLE 0 0 051'825'8L 002'€€6'0L 005°'6¥€'2e 0 spidey uoje3
cev'vLL'L02 0 0 yov'aLy'Lel GL9'LEv'8lL €Ly'p08°'19 0 ajopeyd
058°,¢¢€'8¢€C 009'v2s'e 0 051°9p1'v61 008°L¥9'e 008°'092'92 002'v92'01 JOSPUIM
996'80€'8.L 0 0 8¢9'682'2S ESE'ELO'L 086°LYS S00'¥9¥'vT uojjepn
002'902'2L 0 0 009'v02'v¥ ooz'ezt oov'zye’lL 000°2£0'92 SjiIAJUOULIBA
059'¢25'6L 0 0 00L'GLE VI 050'G95'€ 00€°966'C 002'8¥9'82 pisyung
001'2¥0'eL 0 0 006'02€'L€ 00v'¥92 006'892°L 006°289'€E puexoy
G20'8EL'vS1 0 0 £v5°'280'601 0080’2 oonnﬁFw z8e'elz’Le episuQ
‘jooe'Lp¥'e9 0 0 00€'9.2'GE 0 00.'582 00€'6.LE°LC owejey
658°009'61 1 0 0 80%'088°€6 G86'6L2'L 865°'062'L 898'602'€T jjwen
‘006'€EL'VEL 0 . 0 001°c.8'601 00€'e6 002'688' 008°182'1L2 spidey uoje3
009'050'SEL 0SS°LLY 0 |osz'vee'sol ooﬂrnw 0s6°Lie'9 055'660'81 uoje3
002'98L'¥S1'L 006'¢60'8 0 000'268'269 002'€29'99 00z'ielL'ele 00v'¥Si'e ejleg
912'6€€'SL 0 0 118'ev8'2y 0 oov'vie 6ev'182'CE 1918340
£18'082'86 0 0 ze9'vie’sL ¥68'901 961'v00'L 160'198°'L2 [sunen
060'L0%'€9 0 0 069°L2e'se 005'v02 00.'v8 002'96.L'L2 ‘pleyyoolg
62.'€81'001 1£8°'20’L 0 6LE'€L2'0L 0 280'€96'C LEV'E8Y'ST uojueg

SlzZ'yve 98 0 0 1€£'999'85 0 ¥0y'829'y ¥€5'6¥6'2C anasjjeg .
Kpadoid [eay jejol [eyuswdojanag Janon)-1aquui). |equapisay |euysnpuy |einjawwo) |eanynouby i 10 diysumoy

(£ 100) (9 °100) (G "10D) (¥ "100) (€ "100) (2 '109) (1 102) )
SIBUOISSIWLWOY Jo pieog Ajunod Aq pazijenb3 Auadoid |eay
‘sme] pajidwo) uebiydipy U1 40 8602 - L'60Z SUOIIOSS UM 30UBPI0IE U] SPEW Z|0Z Jeak ay} ul uoienjea pue abealoe jo juswajels
funoy uoje]
veov-1

(20-¢ 'A2Y) 809

vy - suoljenjep pazijenby
‘uniliTym uocﬁmwssou £q peopuozog

918 Ainseai] jo uswpedaq uebiyon
‘uoTINTossI wc..ﬂ»o._”._now 2yl Jo Hm>0hnnm 93] poACW J9yeg JI9UOTSSTUWIO)

1e-v-C1#




SJBUOISSIWWOY JO pieog JO :owhw%_m_._o

SI2UOISSIWWOY JO pJeog 9y} Jo YISO

lo0)oa11g uonezijenbg

4@&% =YY e\u:\ \w\.\_\x\ﬁ &

- -7
. \\\\\r\

“CJoz

psleq

I F

8je}S 8y} Jo uoNIISUo 3y} 4O X| SJOIY JO G UONDISS 10 2661 4O L) 'V'd ‘G861 4O #2Z 'V d ‘7861 JO S8E V'd ‘8.6 JO GZZ 'V'd ‘.61 JO 86l "V'd ‘€961
1089 'V'd ‘1661 J0 L. "V'd Jepun paxe} Apadoid Aue aoeIqUIS Jou S0P Jusiuale)s ples Jeyl Ao Jayuny | 10N ‘8602 — L '60Z SUoioas Jo suoisiroid
ay} o} Juensind ui pjay pieoq pies jo Buasw e je ‘1eak Buiodal sy jo judy Ui SIBUOISSIWWOY J0 pieog-au} Aq pazijenba se Ajunod pies uj 10 pue
diysumo} yoea ui suojjeoyisse|o Auadoid |eal jo suolenjeA passasse pue pazijenba ay; ‘Auadoud jeuosiad pue Auadoid jeas ay) Jo uonenjea sjebaibibe ay)
‘fAuadoud jeuosiad ay} jo pue Apadoid jeal 8y} Jo SnjeA Sy} ‘pue| JO SBIO. JO Jaquinu 3y} Jo Juawiale)s anJ} e s| Buiobaio} ayy jeul AJILYTID A93YIH IM

ALNNOD NOLV3 40 SHIANOISSININOD 40 ayvOg ALNNOD 3HL 40 301440

090°'€29'85€’E 188'02L'cL 0 68.°'Lez'8eC’e £88'G93'0¢} 102'96.'26S 008°209'8.¢ funo) soy fejo)
Apadoid |eay [ejoL |ejuawdojanag JanoInD-1aquul} |enuapisay jeuisnpuy |erosswwo) leanynouby
(£ "102) (9 '100) (S "109) (¥ "100) (€ '100) (2 "100) (1 "100) A3 10 diysumoL
s18uoissiwo) Jo pieog Ajuno) Aq pazijenb3 Auadoliy |eay




z6L'8vL'ey 0 0 266'699'0€ 001°250'S 001'220'L 0 sjiiuelod
€12'v92'91L 0 0 6¥6'G90'2L 98y 0ve 8.2'858'c 0 18I0
006'852'€S 0 0 005'016'0€ 000'525'CL 00%'€28'6 0 Buisue
001°'€6€°L02 0 0 00€'6€S'L¥) 00t'8¥L'e 00¥'G0.L'0S 0 abpa puesn
0S8'01L8°LLL 0 0 0S ﬁwwm.mu 002'€€6'01 005'6v€'22 0 spidey uoje3
2eV'PLL L02 0 0 vo*.w..\.v.nw_. GL9'LEV'8L €1¥'v08°'19 0 Sjjoleyd
058°2€¢€'8€2 009'ves'e 0 05L'gvL'v6l 009°L19'e 008°'092'92 00.'v9.'0L JOSpuiny
996'80€'8.L 0 0 829'682'2S €GE'EL0'L 086°LYS S00'¥9v'vT uojlepy
002'902'2L 0 0 009'v0Z'¥v ooz'zel 0ov'eye’lL 000°2€0'92 SJINJUOULIBA
069'v25'6.L 0 0 00L'GLE VY 050'695'¢ 00E'966'C 00z'8v9'8e pjgyung
001°20'€L 0 0 006'0ze’LE 00¥'v92 006'89.'L 006'289'€E puexoy
GZ0'8EL'YSL 0 0 €¥5'280'601 008'€0.L2 ooe'eel’LL z28e'elz’Le . eplauQ
00€'L¥b'e9 0 0 00€'022°GE 0 002682 00€'6.€'L2 owejey
658'009°6L1 0 0 801'088°¢6 G86'612°L 865°062'L 898'602'¢2 uljweH
006'€EL'VEL 0 0 001'€28'601 00¢'e6 002'688°2 008°18¢'Le spidey uoje3
009'050'SEL ) 0SS LLY 0 05S2'v6€'601 00€'L.8 056'L12'9 05556081 uoje3
002'981'PSL'L 006'760'8 0 000°268°269 002'€29'99 ooz'LeL'sle 00v'¥Sh'e ejieg
912'6EE'SL 0 0 L18'ev8'ey 0 oov'vie 6EV'182'CE 181sayd
€18'082'86 0 0 2€9'v1E'6L ¥68'901 961'¥00'L 160°198°'L2 |swiey
060°'20%'€9 0 0 069°L2g'se 00S'v02 00.'v8 002'96.'L2 p|ayyooig
62.'€8L°00L 1£8'€20'L 0 6L€'€L2°0L 0 280'€96'C Lev'eay'se uojusg
Sle'vve'os 0 0 L££'999'8S 0 0v'829'y $€5'676'2C onAsjjed

fpadoid [eay |ejo) leyuawdojenag 18A0IND-1aqui ). lenuapisay lewsnpuj [eDIBWWOY leinynouby A0 4o diysumoy.

(£ 100) (9100) (5 "100) (#100) €100) (2 100) (1 100) i .
Mmalnay Jo spieog Aq panoiddy suonenjep passassy Auadold jeay
"'sme] pajidwog uebiyoi 9y} Jo 8'602 - L'60¢ SUOI0S UM S0UBPIOdOE Ul 9pew g0z Jeak ay} ul uogen|ea pue abeaioe Jo juawolels
: Ajuno9o uojeg
veor-1 -

TV3Y - suopenjep passassy

(20-¢ "Aoy) 809

018 Ainseay| Jo juswipedaq yebiyoy




SIBUOISSIWWIOD JO PIEOY U} JO HIB|D

TE TR

Jopaug :o;mn__m:am_

m._mco_wm_EF_OO J0 pieog uo uosl ..__mr_o
TITT

§ MSN o T 70D

9]elS 8y} JO UoKNIISUOYD 3y} JO X] SDINY JO G UONDSS JO 2661 4O L) 'V'd ‘G861 JO 22 'V d V861 JO G8E V'd ‘8.6l JO SZZ 'V'd ‘¥.61 JO 861 "V'd ‘€961 -
10 89 'V'd LS61 40 L. 'V d 19pun paxe} Apadoid Aue soeiquia Jou saop juswalels pies jeyy AJpao Jaypny | 1N ‘8'602 — L'60C SUoRoas Jo suoisinoid
3y} o} Juensind ui pjay pseoq pies jo Bussw e je ‘1eak Buipodas sy Jo Judy ul s1suoISSIWWOY J0 preog ay} Aq pazijenba se Ajunoo pies u A0 pue
diysumoy yoes u} suonesyissefo Auadoud jeal Jo suolnenjeA passasse pue pazijenba ay} ‘Apadoud jeuosiad pue Apadoud jeas sy} jo uoyen|en ajebaibbe ayy
‘Auadoud jeuosiad ay} jo pue Auadoid jeas ay} Jo anjeA ay} ‘puej o SaIoe JO Jaquinu au} Jo Juawaje)s anl} e si Buiobalo} ay) jeyy AJLLYID AGIYIH IM

ALNNOD NOLV3 40 SHIANOISSINNOD 40 Q¥vodg ALNNOD IHL 40301440

090'€29'85E'E

psieq@

.88'0zl'cl 0 68.°1€2'8¢€2'C £88'G98'0EL 102°962'L6S

Apadoid jeay jejoL

|eyjuswdojanaqg

008°'209'8.€

(£ 100)

(9100)

JanonD-1equir
(G '100)

[efjuapisay
(100)

leujsnpuj

(€ '102)

|elopwwos
(2 100)

[eamnouby
(1100)

£unoy 1o} jejor

A9 0 diysumo |,

M3IARY JO spieog Aq panoiddy suoiienjep passassy Auadold jeay




z6L'8vL'ey 0 0 265'699°0¢ 001°250'S 001°220°L 0 9jjinianod
€LL'v92'9L 0 0 6¥6'G90'Z1 98¥'0vE 8.2'868'¢ 0 19O
oonmﬂnm 0 0 005°0L6°0€ 000'625'2) 00t'c€28'6 0 Buisue
001'€6€'L02 0 0 00E'6ES LY ooy'syl'e 00%'50.°0S 0 abpa pueig
058'0L8'LLL 0 0 0518258 002'€€6'0L 005'6vE‘22 0 spidey uojeq
(454 2WAVI1 T4 0 0 yoy'aLy'Lel GL9'LEv'8L €Ly'P08°19 0 SjopeyD
068°,€€'8€T 009'ves'e 0 0SL'ovL'v6l 009°Lb9'e 008'092°'92 002'%92'01 JOSPUIN
996'80€'8.L 0 0 8¢9'682'2S mmm.w 10°'L 086°LYS S00'v9P've uojjepy
002°'902'2L 0 0 009'v02'vv 00z'zzL oov'zye’lL 000°2€£0°'92 SjIINJUOLUIBA
059'¥2S'6. 0 0 00L'sLE' vy 050'G95'€ 00£'966°'2 002'8¥9'8¢ Emu::m
001'z¥0'eL 0 0 006°02€'2€ 00¥'¥92 006'892°L 006°289'€E puexoy
G20'8EL'vS1 0 0 €+5°280'601 008'€0L'2 00e‘eel’lL — z8e'elz’Le BpiauQ
00€'L¥¥'e9 0 0 00€°'922'G¢ 0 00,682 00€'6LE"L2 owejey|
658'009'6L1 0 0 801'088'c6 G86'612'L 865'06¢2°)L 898'602'ce Uywey
-006'€EL'PEL 0 0 00L°€28'601 00€'e6 002'688‘C 00818212 spidey uoje3
009'05S0'SEL 0SS'LLY 0 052'v6€'60L oon@nw 056'L12'9 055'S60'81 uojey
‘jooz'ogL'¥SL'L 006'¥60'8 0 000'268'269 002'€29'99 ooz'iezl'sle 00¥'¥SP'e ejjleg
912'6€€'GL 0 0 118°'ev8°ey 0 oov'vie 6ev'182'CE 19)s9yd
€18'082'86 0 0 ze9'vie’sL $68'901 961'¥00°'L 160°198'L2 |sue)
060°'20%'€9 0 0 069°12e'se 005'v02 00L'%8 002'96.'L2 ‘Pi8jo0Ig
62.'€81'00L 1£8'€20'L 0 6.E'€L2'0L 0 280'€96°C Lev'esy'se uojuag

Gle'vve'o8 0 0 1££'099'85 0 ¥0¥'829'y ¥€5'6¥6'¢e anAsjjeg .
>twao._n_ jeay |ejoi _mucmEno_m>mn_ JanoinD-1aquul | |ejuapisay jeujsnpuj |elniswwoe) _N._:~_:otu< 3_0 10 Q__._wsso L

(£ "109) (9 '100) (S "100) (¥ "100) (€ "10D) (2 '100) (1 "109)
SJaUOISSIWWOY Jo pieog Aunod Aq pazijenb3 Auadold |eay
‘sme] pajidwo) uebiysin au3 JO 8°60Z - L'60Z SUOIOSS UJIM 22UBpI0IJE. Ul SpBW Z10Z Jeak ay} ul uonenjea pue abeaioe Jo Juswajels
fAjuno9) uojey
veovr-1

(20-¢ "Asy) 809

|—<mm = m:o_um_.__ﬂ> ﬂ@N:NSCN . . 21S Ainseal jo juswyedaq uebiyoip
‘un3ilTym JI9UOTSTWWO) h,or pepuocag *uUoOTINJosoa MGMBOHHOM o2yl jo H&SO&Q&G 9yl p|ACU Joyeg J9UOTSSTUO)

1e-9-C1#




SISUOISSIWWOY JO pieog JO cowl_mn_\.m;o SJ9UOISSIWWOY JO pJeog auy} JO 9D

W=

Jojoauq uonezienby

psieq

1N
~) \, ]

/&
~TJoz hyE T
"SIBIS 8y} Jo uonNHISUOD 8} 4O X| SO JO G UOHODS 0 266 4O L7l V'd ‘G861 4O ¥ZZ 'V d ‘7861 JO GBE "V'd ‘8.6l 4O GZZ 'V'd ‘V261 40 861 'V'd ‘€961
4089 °V'd :LG61 40 L2 "V'd Jopun paxe} Apadoid Aue eoeIqS Jou SSOP JUSWSIE)S PIES Jey) A0 Jauuny | ~1OIN '8'60Z — L'60Z SUOIOSS JO suoisiAold
ay} o} juensind v} pjay pJeoq pies jo Buneaw e je ‘1eak Buiodal ay) jo judy ul SISUCISSILLLOY JO pIeog ay} Aq pazjjenbs se Aunoo pies i Ao pue
diysumo} yoes 1 suopesyisselo Auadoid jeal o suolenjen passasse pue paziienba ay} ‘Auadoud jeuosiad pue Auadoid jeas ayy jo uonenjea sjebaibbie ayp
‘Apadoud jeuosiad sy} jo pue Apadord jeas sy} o anjea sy} ‘puej Jo SAIOE JO JOGWINU ay} Jo Juswle)s anJj e s| buiobaio) ay) jeul A4ILYTD AGINIH IMN

ALNNOD NOLVY3 40 SHINOISSINNOD 40 a¥v0g ALNNOD JHL 40 30i440

090°€29'8SE'E

288'0CL'EL

0

Auadoud |eay [ejo )

|eyuawdojanaq

68.°1L€2'8€2'C

£88'G98°0E1

102'96.°265

008°209'82€

(£ "100)

(9 "100)

Janond-sequuiy
(S "100)

lenuapisay

(¥ "100)

lelysnpuy
(€ 100)

|elnIsWwwo)
(2 '109)

jeanyinouby
{1 "100)

funo) Joy jejoy

ApD Jo diysumo .

SIauoissiwwog jo pieog Ajunog Aq paziienby Apadoid jeay




ceL'syL'ey 0 0 265°699°'0€ 001'250'S 001°'220°2 0 o|AIeNo0d
[A WA LoTA ] 0 0 6¥6'G90'CL ogy'ove 812'968'¢ 0 1BNIO
006'852'€S 0 0 005'016'0€ 000'625'2} 00+'€28'6 0 Buisue
001'€6€'102 0 0 00€'6€S'L¥) oov'syl’e 00¥'50.L'0S 0 abpa puei
058'018°LLL 0 0 0S _‘.,wwm.w.\. 00z'ce6'0L 005°'6¥€'2e 0 spidey uojeg
cev'yLL'L02 0 0 Yob'8.Ly'LCL GL9'LEY'8L €L¥'v08°1L9 0 ojjopeyd
058'2€€'8€C 009'¥2S'€ 0 0SL'ovL'v6lL 009'L¥9'e 008'092'92 00.'¥9.'0L 10spuim
996'80€'8L 0 0 829'682'2S €5€'€10°'L 086'L¥S G00'vov've uojepy
002'902'2L 0 0 009'¥02'vv ooz'eel oov'zy8’L 000'2£0'92 SIINJUOUIBA
059'v2S'6.L 0 0 00L'GLE VY 050'695°€ 00€'966'C 002'8v9'8e pjayung
001'210'€L 0 0 006°'02¢'.€ 00¥'v¥92 006'89.2'L 006'289°€E puexoy
S20'8EL'YS1 0 0 €¥5'280'601 008°€02'2 ooe'eel'LL 28c'eLz’le . Bplauo
00¢'L¥Y'€9 0 0 00€'9.2°GE 0 002582 00e'6.¢€'22 owejey
6G8'009°6L1 0 0 80v'088°'¢6 G86'6LZ'L 865°'062'L 898'602'€2 uljweH
006'EEL'VEL 0 0 001'c28'601 00€'e6 00.'688'2 008'182'le spidey uoje3
009'050'SE} 0SS'LLY 0 052'v6¢£'601 00€'LL8 056°'112'9 055°660°8L uojeq
00zZ'98L'¥S1L'L 006'v60'8 0 000°268°269 002'€29'99 00z'lLelL'ele 00¥'¥SP'e ejjeq
91.'6EE'SL 0 0 L18'€y8'CY 0 00¥'vie 6E¥'182'2€ 1915840
£18'982'86 0 0 2€9'p1E'SL $68'901 961'%00'L 160°198°'L2 |1swey
060'L0¥'€9 0 0 069'128'SE 00S'v0Z 00.'v8 002'96.'L2 pewyoosg
62.'€8L'001 1£8'€20°'L 0 6.e'eLL'0L 0 280'€96'C Lev'esy'se uojuag
GL2'vve'98 0 0 L£€'999'8S 0 0v'829'v Y€5'6¥6'CC onAgjjeg

Auadoid [eay |ejo) |ejuswdojanaq Janond-1aquul L |enuapisay leuisnpuj [eloIBWwWo) Jesnynouby A9 10 diysumo,

(£ 100) (9100) (5 100) (¥ 100) (€100) (z100) (1 100) ,
MaINRY J0 spieog Aq panoiddy suonenje) pessassy Auadold [eay
‘smen] pajidwo) uebiydiN 2yl J0 8°602 - |L°602 SUOIDI3S YIIM SoUEpiodde Ul 9pew Z1.0¢ 1eak ay} ui uoienjen pue abeaioe Jo Juawslels
: fjuno9g uojex
veor-1 .

1V3Y - suoienjep passossy

(20-¢ "A2¥) 809

OLS fuinsea| jo juswpedsq yebiyaiy




SISUOISSIIWIOD JO pieog dU} JO H9ID

Jojoasqg uonezienby

SIBUOISSILUWOD O pIeog JO comhw&_mso . :
4 e 7 e \,_W&\W\N 7

| § m\_& "oz T Uy peea

"S1ElS 8y} JO UoHNISUOD 8y} JO X| SOINY JO G UOHOSS 10 2661 JO L7l V'd ‘G861 JO ¥ZZ 'V d ‘¥861 4O GBE "V'd ‘8.6l 10 GZZ 'V'd ‘P61 40 861 V'd ‘€961 -
4089 'V'd :1S61 40 L. "v'd 19pun paxe} Auadoid Aue soeiquIL Jou S0P JUSWSIE)S PIES Jey) Aad Jayung | 1O ‘8602 — L'60Z SUoRoas Jo suoisiaoid
ay o} juensind ul pjay pieoq pies jo Buiesw e je ‘teak Buiodal ay) jo judy ul s1auoIssIWWOY Jo pieog sy} Aq pazijenbs se Ajunoo pies ul Ao pue
diysumoy yoee ui suolesyissejo Apadord |eas Jo suoijen|ea passasse pue pazijenba ay} ‘Auadoid jeuosiad pue Apadoud |eas ay} jo uoienjeA sjebaibbe ay}
‘Apadoud jeuosiad ay jo pue Apadoid [eas sy} 4o anjeA ay} ‘pue] JO SSIO. JO JAGINU Sy} JO JUSLLIA)B)S anl) B si BujoB6a10} 8y} Jeyy A4ILNID AGTIYIH IMN

ALNNOO NOLV3 40 SHINOISSINNOD 40 G¥YOd ALNNOD TJHL 40 391440

090'€29'8G€E'E 188'0zL'el 0 68.'1€2'8€2'C £88°698'0€1 10.'962°L6S 008°'209'8.€ fyuno o} jejor
Auadoid jeay jejo jejuswdojanaq JaAond-1aquil | leljuapisay feujsnpuy |eiosawwon) leanynouby A 10 d
(£ "100) (9 '100) (g "100) (¥ "10Q) (€ "100) (2 "109) (1 100) A3 Jo dnysumoL
: MBIAY Jo spieog Aq panoiddy suonenjep passassy Auadoid jeay




S1VL10l - fjaedold jeay pue Jeuosiad

268°'€51'2S 268'€SY'2S 001°602'6 001'S0L'6 26L'8vL'ey 26L'spl'ey 000 ajpispod
LOV'¥26'LL 19v'v26'Ll 8¥.'659°L 8¥.'659'L eLL'p92'9L €1L'v92'91 1000 1oNI0
00.'686'GS 002'S86'GS 008'92.C 008°'92.'2 006°852'€S 006'852'€S 000 Buisue
00g'LLeCLe oog'zLe'eie 002'¥26'01 002'¥26'0L 001L‘€6€'102 00L'e6€'102 000 abpa puein
050'228'921 050'228'92L 002°190°S1 ooN. 190'GL 058'018'LLL Jjoss'oLgLLL 000 spidey uoje3
999'0¥8'9¢€2 999'0%3'9€T v€2'921'62 vee'ozl'ee ZEP'PLL'L02 ZEV'YLL'L02 000 ayopeyd .
050°260'252 050°'260'252 002'6G.2°'El 002'662'€L , 058°'.€€'8€2 058°'L£€'8€2 000 Jospuipy
ZLL'T19'18 2121918 9¥L'€0E'E 9v1's08's 996'80€'82 996'80€'82 000 uoyem
006'GLL'PL 006'GLL'VL 00.'605‘2 00.'60S'C 002'902'2L 002'902'2L 000 ajiiquouisp
008'¥00'€8 008'¥00'c8 051‘08%'c 05108’ 059'¥25'6L 059'v25'6L 000 pidyung
00v'908'vL 00#'908'¥. 00€'v9L'L 00€'v9L’L 001'2v0'€L 001'2¥0'€L 000 puexoy
G2L'esv' 191 GZL'esv 191 00L'vLEL 00L'¥LE'L G20'8EL'¥S1 G20'8€L'¥S1 000 episuQ
009'62.'¥9 009'62.'v9 00€'882°L 00e‘88zZ’L 00€°L¥'E9 00€‘L¥'e9 000 oweijey
solL'ee6'eel soL'‘ees'ect obz'zee's ove'eee's 658'009'6L1 6G8'009'6L1 00’0 ujuey
006'881'6€EL 006'881'6€L 000'G50'S 000°G50'S 006'€EL'VEL 006'€EL'VEL 000 spidey uojeq
058'0v9'2y L 058'0¥9'2k1 052'065°2 052°065°L 009°050°GEL 009°050°S€EL 000 uoje
008°'6£8'592'L 008'6£8°'59¢'L ooo.mmw. 332 009°'€59°LLL 002'98L'¥51°L 002'98L'¥G1°L 000 ejlag
791'86%'18 291'96%'18 9ry'es1'e orb'8s1'e 911'6E€'SL 911'68€'SL 00'0 1918940
L6S°6EE"L0L 16G'6EE"L0L 821'250'€ 811'250'C £18'982'86 £18'082'86 000 jouned
YRO'EL6' 9 VH0'EL6'YO ¥56'G05' 56'60G'L 060°0¥'€9 060'L0'€9 00°0 prawjoosg|
125'296'201 226'296'201 . 862'82.°L 86.'821°L 62.'€81'001 62.°€81'001 000 uojusg
195'821°06 195'821'06 982'¥88'¢ 98Z'¥88'¢ G.Z'vve'98 Gl2'vve'98 000 anasjjegd
suonenjep pazijenbs |suonenjep passassy |suonenie paziienbs |suonenjep passassy |suonenjep pazienb3 [suonenjep pessessy | syipaipuny semoy 49 Jo diysumoy
(2 100) (9 '10D) (S '100) (¥ "10D) (€ '100) (z '100) (1 '100) '
Kuedoid jeuosiod . passassy
sn|d |eay |ejoL suojjenjep Auadoid jeuosiad suopenjep Apadoid |eay [ejo) saloy JO JaquinN
‘SMmeT] UO:QEOU :mm_r_o__z 9y} JO 8°60¢ - | "'60¢ SUOlj0aS YlIM 30ueplodde Ul spewl ¢102 Jeak 9y} ul uoljenjen pue wmmw.._ow JO juswalels
‘ Aunoj uojeg
veov-1

(20-¢ "ray) 809

018 Ainseal] jo Juswpedaq uebiyoin




ROCER L)

SISUOISSIWWOY JO pieog Jo uosiedngyd , SISUOISSILILIOY JO PIEOg BY} JO YISO 10}9311(] Uonezienby

\\w 1 wETVEW T ) T 4
| AR B PR

"9Je}S aU} JO uoNIISUOD dY} JO X]-S[OIHY JO G UOHDISS 10 Z66| JO Lvl 'V'd ‘G861 4O ¥2Z 'V d ‘861 4O G8E 'V'd ‘8.6 40 SZZ 'V'd ‘¥.6) 0 861 'V'd ‘€96)
1089 'V'd 'LG61 40 2/ V' d Jopun paxe} Apadoid Aue soeiquis Jou SS0P JusLUSIe]S pies jeu} Apue0 Jayuny | 1D\ ‘'8°602 — L'60g Suonoes Jo suoisiaoid
ay} 0} Juensind ul pjay pseoq pies jo Bupasw e je eak Buiodal ayj jo Judy Ul SIBUOISSIWILWIOY JO pieog au} Aq pazijenba se Ajunoo pies ul Ajio pue
diysumoy yoes uj suojjeolsse(o Apadoid [eal JO SUolen|eA passasse pue pazijenba sy} ‘Apadoid [euosiad pue Apadold jeal sy} Jo uojenjea ojebalbbe ay)
‘Apadoud jeuosiad ay} jo pue Auadoid |esi Sy} o @njeA Sy} ‘PUB| JO SIIOE JO JBqUINU B} JO JUSLISIESS any} e s| BuioBaio} ayl 18Ul AJILYID AG3YIH IM

ALNNOD NOLY3 40 SHIANOISSININOD 40 a¥v0o8 ALNNOD IHL 40 301440

961°'262'119'E 961°262'119'€ om_‘.v.mw.wmw 9E1'$€9'25¢2 090'€29'85€'S 090°'c29'85€'S 000 . funoy 104 sjejo
suonen|eA pazijenb3 [suonenje/\ passassy [suolenep pazijenb3 |suonenje pessassy |suolienjep pazijenb3 |suonenjeA pessassy | SYipaipuny seiy 9 10 diysumo.
(2 100) (9100) (G '100) (¥ "100) (€109) * ( "100) (1 "100) ' ’
Auadoid jeuosiad passassy
snid [eay |ejol suopenjep Apadoid jeuosiad . suonenjep Apadoid |eay [ejoL $910Y JO JoquInN




#12-4-32
EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
APRIL 18, 2012

RESOLUTION TO SUBMIT TO A VOTE OF THE ELECTORATE
TO RENEW THE MILLAGE FOR
COMPREHENSIVE EMERGENCY TELEPHONE SERVICES (911 SERVICES)
Introduced by the Ways & Means Committee

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the following resolution. Seéondedby
Commissioner Hosey.

WHEREAS, Eaton County desires to continue to operate and maintain county-wide emergency
telephone and dispatch services for the benefit of the citizens of the County; and

WHEREAS, 911 emergency telephone and dispatch services are of substantial benefit to the
citizens of the County

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the following question be submitted to a
vote of the electorate of Eaton County at the primary election to be held August 7, 2012.

9-1-1 AND CENTRAL DISPATCH MILLAGE
RENEWAL QUESTION

For the purpose of continuing funding for a comprehensive, Countywide Enhanced 9-1-1
Emergency Telephone and Central Dispatch System, shall the constitutional limitation
upon the total amount of taxes which may be assessed in one (1) year upon all taxable
real and tangible personal property within the County of Eaton, Michigan, be increased
in an amount not to exceed 0.95 mill ($0.95 on each $1,000 of taxable value) for a period -
of five (5) years (2014-2018) inclusive and shall the County levy such millage for said
purposes? If approved and levied in its entirety, this millage would raise an estimated
$3,154,049 in 2014 to be distributed to the countywide 9-1-1 and Central Dispatch
System as prov1¢1ed in the Eaton County 9-1-1 Service Plan. A small portion of the
revenue collected (approximately $47,311 in 2014) may be required to be distributed to
Downtown Development Authorities, Tax Increment Financing Authorities, Local
Development Financing Authorities and Brownfield Redevelopment Financing
Authorities established in the cities of Charlotte, Eaton Rapids, Grand Ledge, Potterville
and Olivet. '

YES []
NO [1 ;and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that this question is hereby certified to the County Clerk;
and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the County Clerk is hereby directed to cause. this

proposed question to be stated on the August 7, 2012 ballot and to be prepared and distributed in
the manner required by law.

Hdrive/Resolutions/2008/ New Millage for Comp Emerg Phone Services




| #12-4-33
EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

APRIL 18, 2012

RESOLUTION TO SUBMIT TO A VOTE OF THE ELECTORATE
TO RENEW THE JUVENILE MILLAGE

Introduced by the Ways and Means Committee

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the followmg resolution. Seconded by
Comm1ssmner Baker.

- WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners desires to continue funding to detain and house
~ delinquent juveniles and protective services for abused and neglected children and to continue
and improve prevention and treatment programs for such juveniles and chlldren and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners wants to provide financial stability necessary for
sound planning through a continuation millage.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the folldwing question be submitted to a vote
of the electorate of Eaton County in the primary election to be held August 7, 2012.

JUVENILE MILLAGE AUTHORIZATION QUESTION

Shall the previously voted increase in the tax limitation and levy imposed under the Michigan
Constitution by the County of Eaton be renewed in an amount not to exceed 0.35 mill ($0.35 on
each $1,000 dollars of taxable value) against all taxable real and tangible personal property
within the County of Eaton for a period of (5) five years, 2014 to 2018, inclusive, for the
purposes of continued funding of detaining and housing Eaton County juveniles who are
delinquent, to provide protective services for abused and neglected children, and to operate new
and existing prevention and treatment programs for such juveniles and children? If approved and
levied in full, this millage will raise an estimated $1,162,018 for juvenile housing and programs
during the first calendar year of the levy based on taxable value. A small portion of the revenue
collected (approximately $18,011 in 2014) may be required to be distributed to Downtown
Development Authorities, Tax Increment Financing Authorities, Local Development Financing
Authorities and Brownfield Redevelopment Financing Authorities established in the cities of
Charlotte, Eaton Rapids, Grand Ledge, Potterville and Olivet. :

- YES[ 1] NO[ ]
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that this question is hereby certified to the County Clerk; and
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the County Clerk is hereby directed to cause this

proposed question to be stated on the August 7, 2012 ballot and to be prepared and distributed in
the manner required by law. Carried.




#12-4-34
'EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
APRIL 18,2012

RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE APPLICATION FOR EATON COUNTY
UNITED WAY GRANT

Introduced by the Ways and Means Committee

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the following resolution. Seconded by
Commissioner Baker.

WHEREAS, the Eaton County United Way has grant funds available through an inter-
agency agreement with the United Way; and

"WHEREAS, the Day Treatment Program is requesting approval to apply for a grant to
develop the Literacy Improves Future Earnings (L.LF.E) Program; and

WHEREAS, the grant would provide funding to hire contractual Literacy Teachers who
will focus on improving student reading and comprehension skills through securing
literacy materials, determining deficiencies and program eligibility, meeting with students
bi-weekly and working with Youth Facility Workers to support literacy efforts of the
program; and

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Commissioners authorize
the Circuit Court — Day Treatment Program to submit a grant application in an amount
not to exceed $20,000 for the period of October 1, 2012 to September 30, 2013 requiring
no matching funds; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that if the County’s participation in the grant is
discontinued or requires a County General Fund contribution, the continuation of the
grant funded positions will be reviewed by the appropriate committees to determine the
necessity of General Fund commitment; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Controller be authorized to approve any
necessary budget amendments to increase expenditures and increase grant revenue if the
grant is approved by Eaton County United Way; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Chairperson of the Board of Commissioners
be authorized to sign any necessary documents. Carried.




#12-4-35

EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
APRIL 18,2012

RESOLUTION TO APPROVE TITLE IV-D COOPERATIVE
- REIMBURSEMENT APPLICATIONS

Introduced by the Ways and Means Committee

 Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the following resolution. Seconded By
Commissioner Barr.

' WHEREAS the Friend of the Court and Prosecuting Attorney have part1c1pated in the Title IV-D
Cooperative Reimbursement Program with the State of Michigan Department of Human Services in
previous years; and, : '

WHEREAS, the grant applications for the 2012/2013 ﬁscaleyear are being prepared in an amount
not to exceed $1,600,000 for the Friend of the Court and $150,000 for the Prosecuting Attorney.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that

1. The Department of Human Serv1ces Title IV D- Cooperatlve Reimbursement grant
applications are authorized; and

2. The Chairperson of the County Board of Commissioners is hereby authorized to
execute said agreements on behalf of the County Board of Comnuss1oners upon approval
by the State |

Carried.




#12-4-36

EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
- APRIL 18, 2012 ’

RESOLUTION TO APPROVE
2011/2012 BUDGET AMENDMENTS

Introduced by the Ways and Means Committee

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the following resolution. Seconded by
Commissioner Ridge. :

WHEREAS, the Eaton County 2011/2012 Appropriations Act of September 21, 2011 states that
any amendment to increase a salary and/or a Capital Outlay line-item in excess of $2,500.00 or
any amendment to increase the total budget of any fund or department in excess of $2,500.00
shall be amended by the Board of Commissioners, except that any amendment to decrease the
General Fund Contingency shall be approved by the Board of Commissioners; and

WHEREAS, such amendments are needed in order to comply with the Uniform Budgeting and
Accounting Act of 1978, P.A. 621. .

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the following budget aniendments be approved
and added to the 2011/2012 Eaton County Budget:

GENERAL FUND

COUNTY CLERK - 215
Increase C - Wége and Fringe . $ 9,500
Decrease Contingency ' $ 9,500

To increase budget for temporary employee to assist office for four months during election’
process. Carried.




#12-4-36
EATON C'OUNTY-‘BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
APRIL 18, 2012

RESOLUTION TO APPROVE
2011/2012 BUDGET AMENDMENTS

Introduced by the Ways and Means Committee

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the following resolution. Seconded by
Commissioner Boles.

WHEREAS, the Eaton County 2011/2012 Appropriations Act of September 21, 2011 states that any
amendment to increase a salary and/or a Capital Outlay line-item in excess of $2,500.00 or any
amendment to increase the total budget of any fund or department in excess of $2,500.00 shall be
amended by the Board of Commissioners, except that any amendment to decrease the General Fund
Contingency shall be approved by the Board of Commissioners; and

WHEREAS, such amendments are needed in order to comply w1th the Uniform Budgeting and
Accounting Act of 1978, P.A. 621.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the following budget amendments be approved and
added to the 2011/2012 Eaton County Budget:

GENERAL FUND

SHERIFF -301
Increase Wage and Fringe : $ 27,780
Decrease ' Contingency '$ 27,780

To increase budget for the cost of an entry level deputy for courthouse security as recommended by the
Public Safety Committee.
Carried. Nays, Commissioners Brehler and Eakin.




- #12-4-36

EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
APRIL 18, 2012

RESOLUTION TO APPROVE
2011/2012 BUDGET AMENDMENTS

Introduced by the Ways and Means Committee '

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the followmg resolution. Seconded by
Commissioner Rldge

WHEREAS, the Eaton County 2011/2012 Appropriations Act of September 21, 2011 states that any
amendment to increase a salary and/or a Capital Outlay line-item in excess of $2,500.00 or any
amendment to increase the total budget of any fund or department in excess of $2,500.00 shall be
amended by the Board of Commissioners, except that any amendment to decrease the General Fund
Contingency shall be approved by the Board of Commissioners; and

WHEREAS, such amendments are needed in order to comply with the Uniform Budgeting and
Accounting Act of 1978, P.A. 621.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the following budget amendments be approved and
added to the 2011/2012 Eaton County Budget:

SPECIAL REVENUE FUND

CONSTRUCTION CODE - 240
Increase v Wage and Fringe '$ 5,900
Increase . Fund Balance Carryover $ 5,900

To increase budget for the electrical inspector.fo increase from 32 to 40 hours per week as recommended
by the Public Works and Planning Committee. Carried.




#12-4-36

EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
APRIL 18, 2012

RESOLUTION TO APPROVE
2011/2012 BUDGET AMENDMENTS

Introduced by the Ways and Means Committee -

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the following resolution. Seconded by Commissioner
Baker.

WHEREAS, the Eaton County 2011/2012 Appropriations Act of September 21, 2011 states that any
amendment to increase a salary and/or a Capital Outlay line-item in excess of $2,500.00 or any
amendment to increase the total budget of any fund or department in excess of $2,500.00 shall be
amended by the Board of Commissioners, except that any amendment to decrease the General Fund
Contingency shall be approved by the Board of Commissioners; and

WHEREAS, such amendments, are needed in order to- comply with the Uniform Budgeting and
Accounting Act of 1978, P.A. 621.

‘NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the following budget amendments be approved and
added to the 2011/2012 Eaton County Budget:

SPECIAL REVENUE FUND
COMPUTER FUND - 298
Increase ’ Wage and Fringe $ 11,100
- Increase Computer Services Revenue $11,100

‘To increase budget for use of interns in Information Systems.  Carried.




#12-4-36
EATON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
APRIL 18,2012

RESOLUTION TO APPROVE
2011/2012 BUDGET AMENDMENTS

Introduced by the Ways and Means Committee

Commissioner Mulder moved the approval of the following resolution. Seconded by
Commissioner Boles. ' :

WHEREAS, the Eaton County 2011/2012 Appropriaﬁons Act of September 21, 2011 states that any
amendment to increase a salary and/or a Capital Outlay line-item in excess of $2,500.00 or any
amendment to increase the total budget of any fund or department in excess of $2,500.00 shall be

amended by the Board of Commissioners, except that any amendment to decrease the General Fund

Contingency shall be approved by the Board of Commissioners; and

WHEREAS, such amendments are needed in order to comply with the Uniform Budgeting and
~ Accounting Act of 1978, P.A. 621.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the following budgetramendments be approved and
added to the 2011/2012 Eaton County Budget: B

SPECIAL REVENUE

PUBLIC INIPROVEMENT - 245 |
Increase ’ Capital Equipment : $ 15,000
Increase Fund Balance Carryover $ 15,000

To increase budget for additional security cameras in the courthouse building.
Seconded by Commissioner Boles.
Commissioners Boles, Whittum, Baker, Brehler, Hoffman, Brunette, Mulder and Freeman
spoke about the addition of security cameras in the courthouse. ‘
" Commissioner Boles moved to refer the request for security cameras back to the Public Safety
" Committee for further review. Seconded by Commissioner Osieczonek. Carried. Nays; Hosey,

Brehler.




|

EATON COUNTY, MICHIGAN

Ordinance No.__

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE
CODE, AS AMENDED, TO PROVIDE FOR VIOLATIONS OF SAID ORDINANCE TO BE

MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTIONS; TO DESIGNATE AUTHORIZED LOCAL OFFICIALS

RESPONSIBLE TO ENFORCE MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTION VIOLATIONS OF THE
2009 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; TO PLACE THE VIOLATIONS

“BUREAU AT THE DEPARTMENT.OF CONSTRUCTION CODES; TO ADOPT A SAVINGS = -
- CLAUSE: AND TO PROVIDE AN EFFECTIVE DATE. . - o

'THE COUNTY OF EATON ORDAINS:

SECTION 1. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 106.6 OF THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL
' " PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND

ENFORCEABLE THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPA'RTMENT OF
ENERGY, LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION

'CQDES, AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY. -

'The 2009 International Property Mainfehance Code is amended to"add a new subsection

106.6 to read-as follows:
Section "1064.6 ’Vi-dla'ribn-benalﬁeé;

A. Any violation of -any provision of any subsection of the 2009 International Property .
Maintenance Code or any exception granted thereunder, shall be a municipal civil
infraction. A violation includes any act, which is prohibited or made or declared, to
‘be unlawful or an offense and any omission or failure to act where the act is required

. by thie 2009 International Property Maintenance Code.

_ B. The sanction for.any violation of any subsection of the 2009 International Property
- Maintenance Code which are municipal civil infractions shall be a civil fine as provided
~in subsection 106.7 plus any costs, damages, expenses and other sanctions, as

‘authorized under Chapter 87 of Act No. 236 of the Public Acts of 1961, as amended,
. and other applicable laws. S R - v

~ C. The Director of the Eaton. County Department of Construction Codes and Eaton

County Department of Construction Codes Building, Electrical, Mechanical and

~ Plumbing Inspectors are authorized to issue municipal civil infraction citations and

municipal civil infraction violation notices for violations of any subsection of the 2009
International Property Maintenance Code. ,




D. Inaddition to enforcement of violations as municipal civil infractions, enforcement of
violations of any subsection of the 2009 International Property Maintenance Code
may be accomplished by civil action, along with any other remedies provided by law.
Violation of the Ordinance is hereby declared a nuisance, per se, and adjudication of

responsibility for a municipal civil infraction violation of any subsections of the 2009 - - -

International Property Maintenance.Code shall not preclude other civil proceedings
to-abate such nuisance. A : '

E. Each day that a violation exists constitutes a separate ihfr‘ac'ribn. :

- SECTION 2. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 106.7 TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL
- PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND
ENFORCEABLE THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF
', . ENERGY, "LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF
~ CONSTRUCTION CODES, AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY. -

- The 2009 Inferna‘tibn’al Property Ma'infe'na.n‘cé Code is amended to°add a new subsection
106.7 toread as follows:  ~ = . - T
Section 106.7 Schedule of Fines
A Ggﬁ’efal: FiAnes‘ for Municipal Civil Irﬁ‘réi;ﬁon '_Ci"raﬂoris.. o
1. A person; corporation or firm who violates any provision of any subsection of
- 'the 2009 International Property Maintenance Code and is found responsible
at the District Court for a municipal civil infraction citation, shall pay civil

fines of not less than $100.00 nor more than $500.00, plus costs and other
“sanctions, for each infraction. e o .

2. Repeat offenses shall be subject to increased fines as set forth below. As
* used in this subsection, "repeat offense”, means a second (or any subsequent)
- municipal civil infraction of the same requirement or provision of a subsection -
- of the 2009 International Property Maintenance Code committed by a
.~ corporation, person or: firm within any 36 month period and, for which the
“person- admits . responsibility or is deterimined to be responsible. The
‘increased fine for a repeat offense under any subsection shall be as follows:

(i) The fine for any offense that is a repeat offense shall be no_less
- than $200 plus costs and other sanctions. - ’ '

R (.fi) The fine for any offense that is a second répeat offense shall be no
less than $350 plus cost and other sanctions. - - v




(iii) The fine for any of fense that is a third or Subsequen-’r repeat offéhs
 shall be no less than $500 plus costs and other sanctions.

B. Fines for Violation thicgs :

A person, corporation or firm who, as ‘o result of v,i‘o'laﬁng‘ any provision of a
subsection of the 2009 International Property Maintenance Code that receives a
municipal civil infraction violation notice, upon a determination of responsibility

_thereon, shall pay-an initial civil fine at the Eaton County Department of Construction
Codes Civil Infraction Violations Bureau of $100.00. S

: .(i) In fh-é case of another offense within two yéars. of the dﬁfé'- of the inifidl
~infraction, the civil fine shall be $200.00. (This shall be known as the second
 offense). - S . K : £ o :

» (i) In the case 6f another offense wilthin.two years of the date of the second -
offense, the civil fine shall be $350.00. (This shall be known as the third
offense). .. e PR

o (i_ii) In ‘the case of another offense within two years of the _ddfé of the third
‘ offense, the civil fine shall be $500.00. (This shall be known as the fourth . .
of fense). All subsequent offenses shall be subject foa civil fine of $500.00.

SECTION 3. 'ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 106.8 TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL
‘ g PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND-
'ENFORCEABLE THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF
ENERGY, LABOR =~ & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU ' OF

~ -CONSTRUCTION CODES, AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY.

The 2009 International Property Maintenance Code is amended to add a new subsection * - -
106.8 to read as follows: ‘ g S S
. -4 : :

~ Section 106.8 Location of Violations Bureau

The Municipal Civil Infraction Violations Bureau, fof disposition of violation notices issued
under the 2009 International Property Maintenance Code, shall be located at the
Departiment - of Construction Codes Office in the Eaton County Courthouse,” 1045

Independence Boulevard, Charlotte, MI 48813.

SECTION 4. REPEALER.

- All ordinances in* conflict are repealed only to the exfent necessary to give this ordinance
full force and effect. - : ' - o




SECTION5. SEVERABILITY.

' The various ’parts, sections and clauses of this ordinance are_hereby déclared' to be
severable. Should any part, clause, sentence, paragraph or section of this ordinance be
found invalid or unconstitutional for any reason by any court of competent jurisdiction, any
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remainder of this ordinance. -

SECTION6. SAVINGSCLAUSE. - .. -~ =

All proceedings pending and all rights and liabilities existing; acquired or incurred at the time

this ordinance takes effect are saved and may be consummated according to the law in force -

* ‘when they were commenced.

* The provisiohs.of thjs ordinance are d.rde}"ed to~ take éffgc'r_after.publieajrioh;-'

" I Fran -Fullgh,‘EaTon’ Ccuﬁty 'Cljevrls, _cer"’r_ify’thaf this 6r.-di'r'1qn(:é was adopted by the o

i Ea‘tori County Board of Cbminissibnej'r'si&nd ':publish'éd',bn ‘.f-

.. Fran Fuller, Eator County Clerk

P




EATON COUNTY, MICHIGAN

Ordinance No.

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE 2008 MICHIGAN ELECTRIC CODE AS AMENDED TO -
PROVIDE FOR VIOLATIONS OF SAID ORDINANCE TO BE MUNICIPAL CIVIL
~ INFRACTIONS; TO DESIGNATE AUTHORIZED LOCAL OFFfCIALS RESPONSIBLE TO
 ENFORCE . MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTION VIOLATIONS OF THE 2008 MICHIGAN
ELECTRIC CODE; TO PLACE THE VIOLATIONS BUREAU AT THE DEPARTMENT OF
. CONSTRUCTION CODES TO ADOPT A SAVINGS CLAUSE AND TO PROVIDE AN ,
EFFEC'I'IVE DATE : :

THE COUNTY OF EATON ORDAINS

SECTION 1-. ADDITION OF ARTICLE 80 27 OF THE 2008 MICHIGAN ELECTRICAL
 CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE THROUGH.

~ . RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY, LABOR &

- ECONOMIC GROWTH, -BUREAV OF CONSTRUCTION CODES AND
ENFORCED B‘/ EATON COUNTY.

The 2008 Mlchlgan Elecfrlcal Code is amended to add a new. arhcle 80 27 'ro r'ead as follows

o Ar’ncle 80.27 Mumcnpal Civil Infr'achon

A Any violation of -any provision of any article of the 2008 Mlchlgan Electric Code or
© any exception granted thereunder, shall be a mumcnpal ‘civil infraction. A violation
includes any act, which is prohibited or made or declared, to be unlawful or an
offense and any omission or failure to act where the act is requlred by the 2008_
'Mlchlgan Elecfmcal Code. - : v '

B. The sanchon for any. violation of any article of the 2008 Mlchugan Elecmcal Code -

" which are municipal civil infractions shall be a civil fine as provided in article 80.28, - -
plus any costs, damages, expenses and other sanctions, as authorized under Chapter
87 of Act No 236 of the Public AcTs of 1961, as amended, and other applicable laws.

C. The Director of the Eafon Counfy Departmem‘ of Construction Codes and Ea'ron
County -Department of Construction Codes Electrical Inspectors are authorized to’
issue municipal civil infraction citations and municipal civil infraction violation notices
for vuola'nons of any article of the 2009 Michigan Electrical Code. .

D. In addmon to enforcemem‘ of violations as mumcnpal civil mfracﬂons -enforcement of
~ violations of any article of the 2008 Michigan Electrical Code may be accomplished ‘
by’ civil action, along with any other remedies provided by law. Violation of the




Ordinance is hereby declared a nuisance, per se, and adjudication of responsibility
for a municipal civil infraction violation of any article of the 2008 Michigan Electrical
Code shall not preclude other civil proceedings to abate such nuisance. -
E. Each day thata violation exists _cthﬁfutes a separate infﬁacfion.
" - SECTION 2. ADDITION OF ARTICLE 80.28 TO THE 2008 MICHIGAN ELECTRICAL
‘ . CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE THROUGH
" RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY, LABOR &
-ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU :OF . CONSTRUCTION CODES, AND
"ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY.- Co e T e
~ The 2008 Mii:higdri ‘Electri'ca_l'Code' is amended to add a new or'ri»cle“SO.Z‘IS to read ﬁé fol!oWsﬁ
Article 80:28 Schedule of Finéé | A |
o A. G,éhgral; Fines for Municib_dl ,Civjl Iﬁfbdgfion Cifdﬁbns, o -

- 1. A person, corporation or firm who 'vioqués' fany provision of any article of the

- 2008 Michigan Electrical Code and is found responsible-at the District Court’ .

“for a municipal civil infraction citation, shall pay civil fines of not less than
$100.00 nor more than $500.00, plus costs and other sanctions, for each
© infraction. T T E

" 2. Repeat offenses shall be subject to increased fines as set forth below. As

* usedin this article, "repeat offense”, means a second (or any subsequent)

municipal civil infraction of thie same requirement or provision of any article -

of the 2008 Michigan Electrical Code committed by a corporation, person or

firm ‘within any 36 month period ‘and, for ‘which the person admits
responsibility or is determined to be responsible. The increased fine for a

* repeat offense under any article shall be as follows: - o '

(i) The fine for any offense that is a-repeat offense shall be no less
"~ than $200 plus costs and other sanctions. =~ -

(i) The fine for any ’o'iéfens'e that is a second repeat offense shall be no
less than $350 plus cost and other sanctions. - _ o

(iii) The fine for any offense that isa third or subsequent repeat offense
shall be no less than $500 plus costs and other sanctions.

- B. Fines for Violation No'ric’es’

A person, cobpor_aﬁon or firm who, as a result of violating -imY provision of any article
of the 2008 Michigan Electrical Code that receives a municipal civil infraction




violation notice, upon a determination of responsibility -’rhereon,-shall‘pay an initial

civil fine at the Eaton County Department of Construction Cades Civil Infraction

Violations Bureau of $100.00. -

@) In the case of another offense within two years of the date of the initial
infraction, the civil fine shall be $200.00. (This shall be known as the second

(i) In the case of another offense within two years of the date of the second -

offense, the civil fine shall be $350.00. (This shall be known as the third
. offense). ' I o .

(iii) In the case of another offense within two years of the date of the third

of fense, the civil fine shall be $500.00. (This shall be known as the fourth

offense). All subsequent offenses shall be subject fo a civil fine of $500.00.

'SECTION 3. ADDITION OF ARTICLE 80.29 TO THE 2008 MICHIGAN ELECTRICAL -

CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE THROUGH
" RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT .OF ENERGY, LABOR &
- ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES, AND
ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY.. . o

The 2008 Michigan Electrical Code is amended to add a new article 80.29 to read as follows:

Article 80.29 Location of Violations Bureau

The Municipal Civil _I,nfraéﬁon Violations Bureau, for disposition of violation notices issued

under the 2008 Michigan Electrical Code, shall be located at the Department of Construction
Codes Office in the Eaton County Courthouse, 1045 Independence Boulevard, Charlotte,
Michigan 48813. ' o ' S A

SECTION4. REPEALER.

All ordinances in conflict are repealed only to the extent necessary to give this ordinance
full force and effect. L ' ' '
SECTIONS. SEVERABILITY.

The various parts, articles and clauses ~'of, this ordinance are hereby declared to be
severable. Should any part, clause, sentence, paragraph or section of this ordinance be

found invalid or unconstitutional for any reason by any court of competent jurisdiction, any
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remainder of this ordinance.




SECTION6. - SAVINGS CLAUSE.
Al proceedlngs pending and all rlgh’rs and Itablhfres existing, acquired or mcurred at. The time

this ordinance takes effect are saved and mdy be consummated accordmg to the Iaw in for'ce’
when 'rhey were commenced -

SECTION 7. EFFECTIVE DATE.
The prov:suons of this ordinance are ordered to take effect after' publucahon

I Fran Fuller, Eafon County Cler'k cem‘lfy that this ordmance was adopted by The

".Ea ton Counfy Board of Commnssuoners and publlshed on

It Fllter

Fran Fuller Eaton Coun'ry Cler'k




EATON COUNTY MICHIGAN

Ordmance No

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE 2009 MICHIGAN BUILDING CODE, AS AMENDED, TO
" PROVIDE FOR VIOLATIONS OF SAID ORDINANCE TO BE MUNICIPAL CIVIL
INFRACTIONS; TO DESIGNATE AUTHORIZED LOCAL OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE TO
ENFORCE MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTION VIOLATIONS OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN
BUILDING CODE; TO PLACE THE VIOLATIONS BUREAU AT THE. DEPARTMENT OF
CONSTRUCTION CODES; TO ADOPT A SAVINGS CLAUSE: AND TO PROVIDE AN
- EFFECTIVE DATE. | _ |

 THE COUNTY OF EATON ORDA_INS: -

SECTION 1. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 114 3 OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN.
S BUILDING CODE, AS.AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE
~ THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN -DEPARTMENT. OF ENERGY,

" LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES, .

AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY o

The 2009 Mlchlgan Bunldmg Code |s amended fo add a. new subsechon 1143 to read gs' '
' follows L _ _ : o

Sec'non 1143 Vlola’rlon penal'ﬂes

A Any violation -of - any prowswn of any-subsection of the 2009 Michigan Buu]dmg Code
or any ‘exception granted thereunder, shall be.a municipal civil infraction. A violation .
includes -any act, which is prohibited or made or declared, to be unlawful or an -
offense’and any omission or failure to act where. The acf is’ requ:red by the 2009
Mlchlgan Building Code.. _

~ B. The sanction for any vnolcmon of any subsecnon of the 2009 M:chlgan Bulldmg Code -
which_are municipal civil infractions shall be a civil fine as provided in subsection
1145 plus any costs, damages, expenses and other sanctions, as authorized under -
Chapter 87 of Act No 236 of ‘rhe Public Acts of 1961, as amended, and other
apphcoble |aws _ o :

-G The Director of the Ea‘ron Counfy Department of Construction Codes and Eaton
© County Department of Construction Codes Building Inspectors are authorized to
issue municipal.civil infraction citations and municipal civil infraction violation notices -

for vuolahons of any subsechon of the 2009 Machlgan Bunldmg Code.




D. In addmon to enforcement of violations as munucapol civil mfrachons enforcemenf of
violations of any subsection of the 2009 Michigan Building Code may be accomplished
by civil action, along with any other remedies provided by law. Violation of the
Ordinance is hereby declared a nuisance, per se, and adjudication of responsibility
for ‘a municipal civil infraction violation of any subsections of the 2009 Michigan
Buuldnng Code shall not preclude other civil proceedings fo abate such nuisance.

‘

E. Each day that a vuolaflon exnsfs constitutes a. separofe mfr‘achon

. SECTION 2. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 114 5 TO THE 2009 MICHIGAN o

BUILDING CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE
THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,
LABOR ‘& ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY Ny

" The 2009 Mlchugan Buuldmg code is amended to odd a new subsechon 1145 to r'ead as - - |
follows : , . :

. Secnon 114, 5 Schedule of Flnes ~
A Generol Fines for' Munlapol ClVll Infrac'non leahons E

A person, corporm‘lon or flrm who. violates any. provision of any subsection of
" the 2009 Michigan Building Code and is found responstble at the District
" Court for a municipal civil infraction citation, shall pay civil fines.of not less
than $100.00 nor more than. $500. 00, plus costs and other sanchons for
each mfmcflon :

2 ‘Repeaf offenses shall be subJecf to- increased fines as set for‘rh below As
- used in this subsection, "repeat offense", means a second (or any subsequent) -
- municipal civil infraction of the sanie requirement or provision of a subsection
. of the 2009 Michigan Building: Code committed by a corporation, person or
firm within any 36 month period and, for which the person admits:
- responsibility or'is determined fo be responsible. . The increased fine for a
: repeat offense under any subsechon shall be as follows: o

(|) The fme for any offense that is a repeaf offense sholl be no less Iess
than 520 plus costs and other sanc’nons .

(u) The fme for any offense fhof is a second repeat offense shall be no
less than $350 plus cost and other sanctions..

(i) The fine for any offense that isa ‘l’hll"d or subseauenf reL_T offense‘
‘ shall be no less than $500 plus costs and other sanctions.




'B " Fines 'for Violation Notices.

A person ‘corporation or firm who, as a result of violating any ‘provision of a
subsection of the 2009 Michigan Building Code that receives a municipal civil
infraction violation notice, upon a determination of- responsibility thereon, shall pay
an initial_civil fine at the Eaton County Depar’rmen'r ‘of -Construction Codes Civil

Infrachon Violations Bureau. of $100.00. . .

(i) In the case of anofher offense wﬂ'hln two years of the date of the initial
- infraction, the civil fme shall be §200 00. (Thls shall be known as the second

‘ ffense)

(ii) ]fn the case of ano’rher offense within 'Two years of ’rhe date of the second
offense, the civil fine shall be §3500 (Thls shall be known as the third

ffense)

(m)In The case of another offense wu‘rhm two years of the date of the 1h|rd
~ offense, the civil fine shall be $500.00. (This shall be-known as the fourth -
: offense) AII subsequenf offenses shall be subJecf_foa civil fme of $500.00.

/ .

!

~ SECTION 3. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 114 6 TO THE 2009 MICHIGAN

- - -BUILDING -CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED: AND ENFORCEABLE

- THROUGH RULES OF THE. MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,

LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, "BUREAV OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY. '

~ The 2009 Mlchlgan Bulldmg code |s amended to add a new subsection 1146 fo read as -
- follows: - -.

Sechon 114.6 Loca‘rlon of Vola'rlons Bureau

~ The Munlclpal Civil Infractlon Violations Bireau, for dlsposmon of violation no‘nces lssued
~ under the-2009 Michigan Building Code, shall be located at the Department of Construction .

48813
'..SECTION4 ' REPEALER

All ordinances in confllcf are repealed only to the extent necessary 'ro give fhls ordmance
full force and effecf -

Codes Office in the Eaton Coum‘y Courthouse, 1045: Independence Boulevard Charlotte, MI' :




! SECTION 5. SEVERABILITY.
 The varlous parfs SCC'I’IOHS and clouses of this ordinance are hereby declared to be
severable. - Should any part, clause, sentence, paragraph:or section of this ordinance be
found invalid or unconstitutional for any reason by any court of competent JUI"ISdIC‘l’lOH any
such decision shall not affect the volldn‘y of the remamder of 'l’hlS ordmance

SECTION 6. SAVINGS CLAUSE. e
‘ All proceedmgs pendmg and all rlghts and habllmes exus'rmg, acquured or mcurned at ’rhe time
_ this ordinance takes effect are saved and may be consummated occordmg to fhe law in force
when fhey were commenced . - .
- SECTION 7 EFFECTIVE DATE

. ‘The provus:ons of ThIS ordmonce are ordered to foke effec‘r of‘rer publlccn‘lon

I, Fran Fuller Eoton Coum‘y Clerk cerﬂfy Tho‘l‘ ‘I’hlS ordlnance was odopfed by the.

Eofon Counfy Boord of Commussnoners and publlshed on. SRS _ -._'- :

*“Fran Fuller, Eaton County Clerk a




EATON COUNTY, MICHIGAN

Ordinarice No.

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE 2009 MICHIGAN MECHANICAL CODE, AS AMENDED,
TO PROVIDE FOR VIOLATIONS OF SAID ORDINANCE TO BE MUNICIPAL CIVIL
INFRACTIONS; TO DESIGNATE AUTHORIZED LOCAL OFFICIALS. RESPONSIBLE TO
 ENFORCE MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTION VIOLATIONS OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN
 MECHANICAL CODE; TO PLACE THE VIOLATIONS BUREAU AT THE DEPARTMENT OF
CONSTRUCTION CODES; TO ADOPT A SAVINGS CLAUSE AND TO PROVIDE AN
EFFECTIVE DATE. » L o

THE COUNTY OF EATON ORDAINS:

~

'SECTIONl ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 108.8 OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN
: MECHANICAL CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE

THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,

LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY . :

" The 2009 Mlchlgan Mechamcal Code is amended to add a new subsec'ﬂon 108 8 to r'ead as'
follows: _ ,

Sechon 108, 8 VlO'GTIOﬂ penalties:

A ‘Any violation of any provision of any subsechon of The 2009 Michigan Mechanical _
Code or any exception granted thereunder, shall be a municipal civil infraction. A
violation includes any act; which is prohibited or made or declared, o be unlawful or

~.an offense and any omission or failure.to act where the act is r'equlred by the 2009 _
Mlchlgan Mechamcal Code. .

B. The sancﬂon for any wolahon of any subsechon of 1he 2009 Mlchlgan Mechamcql
Code which are municipal. civil infractions shall be a civil' fine as provided in
subsection 108.9 plus any costs, damages, expenses and' other sanctions, as
authorized under Chapter 87 of Acf No. 236 of the PUb'lC Ac’rs of 1961, as amended,
and other appllcable Iaws ,

C. The Director of the ~Ec_n‘on. County DeparTment of Construction Codes and Eaton
County Department of Construction Codes Mechanical Inspectors are authorized to
issue municipal civil infraction citations and municipal civil infraction violation notices
for vvola’nons of any- subsecﬂon of the 2009 Mlchlgan Mechanical Code.




D. Inaddition to enforcement of violations as municipal civil infractions, enforcement of
violations of any subsection of the 2009 Michigan Mechanical Code may be
accomplished by civil action, along with any other remedies provided by law. - Violation
of the Ordinance is hereby declared a nuisance, per se, and adjudication of

 responsibility for a municipal civil infraction violation of any subsections of the 2009
Michigan Mechanical Code shall not preclude other civil proceedings to abate such

nuisance.

- E. Eachday that a violation exists constitutes a sépqrqte infraction. -

 SECTION 2.

ADDITION 'OF ‘SUBSECTION 108.9 TO ' THE 2009 MICHIGAN
MECHANICAL CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE

THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,

LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES,
AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY. - .

' The 2009 -Michigan Meéhanigal code is amended fo add a hgw subsection 108.9 tdreadf_as;_"-

B fol(ows:.- |

Secfibn_ '1‘0'8’.9,15'cheddl.e of Fines - -

A. General; Fines for Municipal Civil Infraction Citations.

L

A person, corporation or firm who violates any provisions of any subsection of

~ the 2009 Michigan Mechanical Code and is found responsible at the District

‘Court for a municipal civil infraction citation, shall pay civil fines of not less

than $100.00 nor more than $500.00, plus costs and other sanctions, for

“each infraction.

. Repéat offenses shall be subject to increased fines as set _-fbr‘th bélow._ As

“used in this subsection, "repeat offense", means a second (or any subsequent)

municipal civil infraction of the same requirement or provision of a subsection. -

" of the 2009 Michigan‘Mechanical Code committed by a corporation, personor. -
firm “within anhy 36 months period and, for which. the person admits

responsibility or is determined to be responsible. The increased fine fora- - B
repeat of fense under any subsection shall be as follows: SR

| (i) The fine for 'any_ offense that is a repeat offense shall be no less
- than $200 plus costs and other sanctions. -

(i) The fine for aﬁy offense that is a second repeat offensve’- shall be no
less than $350 plus cost-and other sanctions: .

~ (iii) The fine forjany offense that is'a third or subsequent repeat offense
" shall be no less than $500 plus costs and other sanctions.




B. Flnes for Vlolahon Notices

- A person, corpor‘ahon or- firm who as a resuh‘ of violating any provision of a
- subsection of the 2009 Michigan Mechanical Code that receives a municipal civil
infraction violation notice, upon a determination of responsibility thereon, shall pay
an initial -civil fine at the Eaton Coum‘y Department of. Construc'rlon Codes Civil
Infraction V|o|af|ons Bureau of 5100 00. :

(i) In the case of anothier. offense wn'rhm two years of the date of the-initial :
infraction, the civil fme shall be §200:0 (Thus shall be known as 1he second

ffense)

(i) In the case of another offense within two years of The date of fhe second
~ offense, -the civil fine shall be 53500 (This shaII be known as the ’rhlrd
offense). - :

. (iii) In the case of another offense within two years of the date of the third
~offense, the civil fine shall be $500.00. (This shall be known as the fourth
offense).” All subsequent offenses shall be subject to a civil fine of $500.00.

SECTION 3. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 108.10 TO THE 2009 MICHIGAN
S MECHANICAL CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE
- THROUGH RULES OF: THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,
 LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU. OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
- AND ENFORCED BY EATON. COUNTY. ‘ :

The 2009 Mlchugan Mechamcal Code is amended to add a new subsec‘non 108.10 to read as
follows: _ . . : . '

Section 108,.10\L»ocafion of Violafions Bufeau
" The Municipal Civil Infraction Violations Bureau, for disposition of vnolahen notices issued

under the 2009 Michigan -Mechanical Code, shall be ‘located at the Department of
Construction Codes Office in the Eaton Coun'ry Courthouse, 1045 Independence Boulevard,

Charlof‘re Mlchlgan 48813,

SECTION4 ‘ REPEALER

All or‘dmances in conﬂlcf are repealed only to the extent necessary to give this ordmance
full force and effect. . _ o




© SECTIONS. SEVERABILITY.

The. Various‘ parts; sections and clauses of this ordinance are hereby declared to be
severable. Should.any part, clause, sentence, paragraph or section of this ordinance be -
found invalid or unconstitutional for any reason by any court of competent jurisdiction, any -
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remainder of this ordinance. _
SECTION6. 'SAVINGS CLAUSE.

Al proceedings pending and all rights and liabilities existing, acquired or incurred at the time
this ordinance takes effect are saved and may be consummated according to the law in force
- when they were commenced. R T
SECTION7. EFFECTIVEDATE:

The provisions of this .ordilnaﬁqe;dré ordered to .take'effecfjaffer publication.

o I Fraanuller, Eaton County Clerk, éérﬁf_yl_ that this Qrdinc{née.wascddptéd t;yﬁtihe R

‘ E@fo__n‘ County .Bbdrjd of .C_orpmissidh;hs dnd"publi‘s‘h'ed on___.-. '

- 'Fr‘_an Fuller, Eaton Cou‘n'iy Clerk. :

i




EATON COUNTY MICHIGAN

Ordmance No

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE 2009 MICHIGAN PLUMBING CODE, AS AMENDED, TO
PROVIDE FOR VIOLATIONS OF SAID ORDINANCE TO BE -MUNICIPAL CIVIL
INFRACTIONS; TO DESIGNATE AUTHORIZED LOCAL OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE TO
ENFORCE MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTION VIOLATIONS OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN
“PLUMBING CODE; TO.PLACE THE VIOLATIONS BUREAU AT THE DEPARTMENT OF
CONSTRUCTION CODES TO ADOPT A SAVINGS CLAUSE: AND TO PROVIDE AN
EFFECTIVE DATE." : ,

THE COUNTV OF EATON ORDAINS

,‘SECTIVON 1. vADDmO.N' OF SUBSECTION 108.8 OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN
PLUMBING CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE -
THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,
LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES,
AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY. ' :

The 2009 Mlchlgan Plumbmg Code is amended to add a new subsechon 108 8 to read as
follows: , . ,

-Sechon 108 8 Vlolcmon penal’rles

A Any v:olcmon of any provus:on of any subsection of 'rhe 2009 Mlchugan Plumbmg Code

or any exception granted thereunder, shall be a municipal civil infraction.- A violation_
. includes any act; which is prohibited or made or declared, to be unlawful or an =
.~ offense and-any omission or failure to act where the act is required by the 2009 .
, \Mlchugan Plumbmg Code : :

B. - The sanction for any. vuolanon of any subsec’non of the 2009 Mlchngan Plumbmg Code . -
which are municipal civil infractions shall be a civil fine as provided in subsection- -
1089 plus any costs, damages, expenses  and other sanctions, as authorized under

~ Chapter 87 of Act No. 236 of the Public Acts: of 1961 as amended, and. other
appllcable Iaws _ '

C.- The Dlrec'ror of the Eaton Counfy Deparfmen’r of Construcflon Codes and Eaton
* County Department of Construction Codes Plumbing Inspectors are authorized to
issue municipal civil infraction citations and municipal civil infraction violation notices
for violations of any subsection of the 2009 Michigan Plumbing Code.




D. Inaddition to enforcement of violations as municipal civil infractions, enforcement of -
violations of any subsection of the 2009 Michigan Plumbing Code may be
- accomplished by civil action, along with any other remedies provided by law. Violation
of the Ordinance is *hereby declared a nuisante, per se, and adjudication of
responsibility for a municipal civil infraction violation of any subsection of the 2009 -
~ Michigan Plumbing Code listed above shall not preclude o’rher civil proceedmgs to
‘ abofe such nuisance. i : :

E. Each day thaf a viola'rionexis"rs 'cons_’rifufes a sepo_rofe infr_'acﬁon. .

o SECTION 2

. follows

ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 108. 9 TO THE 2009 MICHIGAN

' PLUMBING CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE

THROUGH RULES OF THE - MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,
LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES,

.AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY

The 2009 Mlchlgan Plumbmg Code is amended to add a new subsec'non 108 9 to reod as

=

Secflon 108.9 Schedule of Fmes

A General Fmes for. Mumcvpol CIVIl Infruc’non Cufoflons _ A.

A person corporation. or flrm who violdtes. ony provusmns of any subsec‘non of

" the 2009 Michigan Plumbing Code and is found responsible at the District

~-Court for a municipal civil infraction citation, shall pay civil fines of not less:

- than $100.00 nor_more t than $500 00 plus costs and other sanc'nons for

- euch mfmcflon

'Repeaf offenses shall be: subJecf to lncreased fmes as set forth below As -

used in this subsection, "repeat of fense”, means a second (or any subsequent)

- municipal civil infraction of the same requlremenf or provision of a subsection
~ of the 2009 Michigan Plumbing Code_committed by a corporation, person or

firm within any 36 month period -and, for which the person admits.
responsibility or is-determined fo be responsible. ‘The increased fme for a

repeat offense under any subsecflon sholl be as follows

0) The fme for any. offense that is a repeaf offense shall be no Iess
than $200 plus costs and ofher sanctions. - ‘

(u) The fine for any offense ‘rhat is a second regeof offens shall be no
less than §35 plus cost and ofher sonc‘nons '

(iii) The fine for any of fense 'rhot isa  third or subsequen’f repeat offense
shall be no less than $500 plus costs and other sanctions. '




B. Fines for Violation Notices

A person, corporation or firm who, as a result of violating any provision of a
subsection of . the 2009 Michigan Plumbing Code that receives a municipal civil
iinfraction violation notice, upon a determination of responsibility thereon, shall pay

an initial civil fine at the Eaton Coum‘y Department. of Construction Codes Civil
- Infraction Violations Bureau of §1000

(i) In the case of anofher of ferise within 'rwo years of the date of the mn‘lall
infraction, the civil flne shall be §200 00 (Thus shall be known as the second

offense).

(ii) In the case of another offense within fwo years of the date of fhe second
offense the civil fme shall be $350.00. (Thls shall be known as the fhurd

ffense)

(m) In the case of another offense within two years of fhe date of the third
~ offense, the civil fine shall be $500.00. (This shall be known -as the fourth
-offense) All subsequenf offenses shall be sub JCC‘I‘ toa cuvnl fine of $500 00 :

- SECTION 3. "ADDITION '_O'F. SUB’SECT’ION,“ ‘108.10 «‘. TO' THE - 2009 MICHIGAN ‘
R PLUMBING CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE -
THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,
LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF. CONSTRUCTION CODES

- AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY. : .

The 2009 Mlchlgan Plumbmg Code is. amended to odd a new: subsecfuon 108, 10 to read as.

- follows:

" Section 108.10 Locahon of Vlolaflons Bureau

~ The Mumcupal Civil Infraction Vlolaflons Bureau, for dlsposmon of vnolaflon notices rssued '
under the 2009 Michigan Plumbing Code, shall be located at the Department of Construction
- Codes Office in the Eoton County Cour‘fhouse 1045 Independence Boulevard,. Charloﬁe,_-_

Mlchlgan 48813.

SECTION 4' REPEALER.

AII ordinances in conflict are r'epealed only to the exfenf necessary to glve this ordlnance
full force and effect. v




** when they were commenced. -

' SECTIONS. SEVERABILITY.
The various pd'rts,. sections ‘and clauses of this ordinarice are hereby declared to be -
severable. Should any part, clause, senfence, paragraph or section of this ordinance be
~ found invalid or unconstitutional for any reason by any court of competent: jurisdiction, any
~ such decision shall not affect the validity of the remainder of this ordinance. - ‘
© SECTIONG. SAVINGS CLAUSE.

Al proceedings pending and all rights and liabilities existing, acquired or inéﬁrred at the time
this ordinance takes effect are saved and may be consummated according to'the law in force -

 SECTION7. EFFECTIVE DATE.
- Thg;_ pifo;/iqions. of _‘1hi_s'ord_inqn¢e' are ordered to take effect after pdblric‘df'i‘cri.,

| 1, Fran Fuller, Eaton County Clgrk,’certify that this ordinance was ddbpfqd by the -

. "Eaton County Board of Commissioners and pﬁb!ish_eﬂ on_

- . 5
. 4 :

- FranFuller, Eaton County Clerk .




EATON COUNTY MICHIGAN

Ordmance No.

. AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE 2009 MICHIGAN RESIDENTIAL CODE AS AMENDED
TO PROVIDE FOR VIOLATIONS OF SAID ORDINANCE TO BE MUNICIPAL CIVIL
INFRACTIONS; TO DESIGNATE AUTHORIZED LOCAL OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE TO
'ENFORCE .MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTION VIOLATIONS OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN
RESIDENTIAL CODE; TO PLACE THE VIOLATIONS BUREAU AT THE DEPARTMENT OF
CONSTRUCTION CODES; TO: ADOPT A SAVINGS CLAUSE AND TO PROVIDE AN

EFFECTIVE DATE

THE COUNTY OF EATON ORDAINS

'SECTION 1. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION R113 5 OF ‘THE 2009 MICHIGAN'_'
: . RESIDENTIAL CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE
"~ THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,
- LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
: AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY :

- The 2009 Mlchlgan Resudem‘lal Code is amended to add a new subsechon R113 5 fo r'ead as

- follows:

Sec'ﬂon R113 5. Vnola‘non penah‘les

A Any wolaﬂon of any provision of any subsechon of the 2009 Michigan Resrdem‘ml
Code or any exception granted thereunder, shall be a municipal civil infraction. A
violation includes-any act, which is prohibited or made or declared, to be unlawful or

_ an offense and any omission or failure to act where the act is requu‘ed by the 2009
‘Mlchlgan Resuden'ﬂal Code.

'B. The sanchon for any violation of any subsec’non of the 2009 M|ch|gan Residential

Code which are municipal civil infractions shall be a civil fine as provided in -

. _subsection R113.6 .plus any “costs, damages, expenses and other sanctions, as.
authorized under Chapter 87 of Act No. 236 of the Public Acts of 1961, as amended,

and other appllcable laws. . '

C. The Director of the Eaton Coun’ry Department of Cons’rruc'non Codes and Eaton

" County Department of Constriction Codes Building, Electrical, Mechanical and
Plumbing Inspectors are authorized to issue municipal civil infraction citations and
municipal-civil infraction violation notices for violations of any subsection of the 2009 :
Mlchlgan Residential Code




D. In oddmon to enforcement of violations as municipal cnvul infractions, enforcement of
violations of any subsection.of the 2009 Michigan Residential Code may be
accomplished by civil action, along with any other remedies provided by law. Violation

~ of the Ordinance is hereby declared a nuisance, per se, and adjudication of -
responsibility for a municipal civil infraction violation of any subsections of the 2009
Mlchlgan Resndem‘ml Code sholl “not preclude other ClVl| proceedmgs to abate such -
nuisance: - : : v

' 'EV.‘ Each day Thcn‘-q' violation exists consfifutes a separate infrac‘ﬁon.

| ,SECTION 2.

'follows

Sechons R113 6 Schedule of Flnes

ADDITION ‘OF SUBSECTION 'R113.6 TO THE 2009 MICHIGAN
RESIDENTIAL CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE

- THROUGH RULES OF THE MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,
"LABOR . & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES, .
- AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY ,

The 2009 Mlchtgan Resuden'rlai code is amended to odd a new subsecﬂon R113 6 to reod as

- A General Fmes for Mumcupal Cuvnl Infr‘achon Cn‘ahons

1

A person corporation or furm who vnolotes any provnsnons of any subsectlon of .

“the 2009 Michigan Residential Code and is found responsible at the District

~ Court for a municipal civil infraction citation, shall pay civil fines of not less

“than $100.00 nor more than $500 00, plus costs and ofher sanc’nons for
~ each mfmcnon ,

: Repeaf offenses shall be subJect to mcr'eased fines as sef for‘fh below As.
‘used in this subsection, “repeat offense”, means a second (or any subsequent)
_municipal civil infraction of the same requirement or provision of a subsection

of the 2009 Michigan Residential Code committed by a corporation, person or

- firm  within . any 36 month period and, for which- the person admits
- responsibility or is determined to be responsible. The increased fine for a
. repeat offense under any subsechon sholl be as foIIows - :

0] The fine for any offense that is a r'epeat offense shall be no_less Iess a
than $200 plus costs and other sonctlons

'(n) The flne for any offense tha'r is.a second repeat offense shall be no
less than $350 plus cost and other sanctions. >

(iii) The fine for any offense that is a third or subsequent r‘epeaf offense
sholl be no less than $500 plus costs.and other sanctlons




B. Fines for Violation Notices

A person, corporation or firm who, as a result of violating any provision of .a

- subsection of the 2009. Michigan Residential Code that receives a municipal civil
infraction violation notice, upon a determination of responsibility thereon, shall pay
an initial civil fine at the Eaton County Department of Construction Codes Cnvnl
Infrachon Violations Bureau of 5100 00. _

(|) In the case of another offense within two years of -the date of the initial

_infraction, the civil flne shall be 52000 (Thls shall be known as the second_ _ L

ffense)

(ii) In the case of anofher offense within two years of ‘the date of ﬂ\e second L
. offense, the civil fme shall be 53500 (Th:s shall be known as. ’rhe third
offense). _

(m)In the case of another offenSe wn‘hm fwo years of the date of 'rhe third
offense, the civil fine shall be $500.00. (This shall be known as the fourth- -
ffense) All subsequenf offenses shall be sub Ject fo a cwul fine of $500.00. 00

SECTION 4. A‘D'DITION, oF» ' SUBSECTION .R'1‘13.7 TO THE 2009 MICHIGAN
- RESIDENTIAL CODE, AS AMENDED, AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE

. THROUGH RULES OF THE. MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY,

LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODEs,
" AND ENFORCED BY EATON COUNTY : : .

a The 2009 MlChlgdl‘I Reﬂdenﬂal code is amended to add a new subsechon R113. 7 'ro read as
follows R ,

Sec‘rlons R113 7 Loccmon of Vlolaﬂons Bureau
 The Mumcupal Civil Infrac'rlon Violations Bureau for disposition of vuola'rlon notices issued
under the 2009 Michigan Residential Code, shall be located at the Department of

- Construction Codés Office in the Eaton County Courfhouse 1045 Independence Boulevard,
_ Charlotte, MI 48813 : _ ,

SECTION 5. REPEALER

Al ordinances in confhcf are repealed only to the extent necessary fo give this ordinance -
- full force and effect.




SECTION 6. - SEVERABILITY.

- The various pdrfs, sections and clauses of this ordinance are hereby declared to be

 severable. Should any part, clause, sentence, paragraph or section of this ordinance be
- found invalid: or unconstitutional for any reason by any court of competent jurisdiction, any
* such decision shall not affect the validity of the remainder of this ordinance. -

'SECTION 7. SAVINGS CLAUSE.

All pro,ceedingé pending qnd all 'righ'r's.;'xr'ud Ifabilifies existing, acquired or incurred at the time

. this ordinance takes effect are saved and may be consummated according to the law in force
when they were commenced. - -~~~ S :

' SECTION 8. EFFECTIVE DATE. -

The proyi#ioris"pf'_fhis"obdinahée:arg ordered 'ré ‘fgkg éffe‘c’r af ter publication.

-1,Fran EQI!eE, Edfon County Clerk, cB},'ﬁfy that this ordinance was adi;pfed‘ by the .. -

o ‘. - .’Ed,fon County Board of Commissioners and quliSheq: on’_ SR

- Fran Fuller, Eaton Co'unﬁCl’érk




EATON COUNTY, MICHIGAN

- Ordinance No.v

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE 2009 MICHIGAN REHABiLITATION ‘CODE - FOR
EXISTING BUILDINGS, AS AMENDED, TO PROVIDE FOR VIOLATIONS OF SAID
ORDINANCE TO BE MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTIONS; TO DESIGNATE AUTHORIZED |

 LOCAL OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE TO ENFORCE MUNICIPAL - CIVIL INFRACTION

VIOLATIONS OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN REHABILITATION CODE FOR EXISTING
"BUILDINGS; TO PLACE THE VIOLATIONS BUREAU AT THE DEPARTMENT OF
CONSTRUCTION CODES ‘TO ADOPT A SAVINGS CLAUSE AND TO PROVIDE AN

. EFFECTIVE DATE.

THE COUNTY OF EATON ORDAINS

- SECTION 1. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 113.5 'OF THE 2009 MICHIGAN
o . REHABILITATION CODE FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS, AS AMENDED,

~AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE 'THROUGH RULES- OF THE
MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY, LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH,
BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES AND ENFORCED BY EATON
'COUNTY. ‘ '

- The 2009 Mlchlgarr Rehabcllfahon Code for Exnshng Bmldmgs is amended to add a new
subsection 113.5 to read as: follows _ T

Sec’ﬂon 113 5 Vlola‘non penah‘les

A Any vrola’non of any provusuon of any subsechon of fhe 2009 Michigan Rehabnhta'ﬂon ,
Code for Existing Buildings or any exception gram‘ed theréeunder, shall be a municipal’
civil infraction. A violation includes any act, which is prohibited or made or declared,
to be unlawful or an offense and any. omission or failure to act where the act is

-required by the 2009 Mlchlgan Rehabilitation Code for' Exustmg Buildings. -

B.. The sanction for any violation of any subsechon of The 2009 Mlchlgan Rehablhfa'non _
Code for Existing Buildings which are municipal civil infractions shall be a civil fine as
- provided in subsection 113.6 plus any costs, damages, expenses and other sanctions,
‘as authorized under Chapter 87 of Act No. 236 of ‘rhe Publtc Acfs of 1961, as
amended, and other applicable laws. - :

C. The Director of the Em‘on- Coum‘y Department of Construction Codes and Eaton
County Department of Construction Codes Building Inspectors are authorized to
issue municipal civil infraction citations and municipal civil infraction violation notices -




for violations of any subsection of the 2009 Miéhigan Rehabilitation Code for
Existing Buildings. - : o . ’

D. Inaddition to enforcement of violations as municipal civil infractions, enforcement of
violations of any subsection of the 2009 Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing
Buildings may be accomplished by civil action, along with any other remedies provided
by law. Violation of the Ordinance is hereby declared a nuisance, per se, and

' adjudication of responsibility for a municipal civil infraction. violation of ‘any
'/ - subsections of the 2009 Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings shall not
_preclude other civil proceedings to abate such nuisance. e

E. Edch day f_hqt a violation exists constitutes a separate infraction. -

" . SECTION 2. ADDITION OF SUBSECTION 113.6 TO THE 2009 MICHIGAN |
. REHABILITATION CODE FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS, AS AMENDED,
AS ADOPTED AND ENFORCEABLE THROUGH RULES OF THE:
' MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY, LABOR & ECONOMIC -
. GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES, AND ENFORCED BY
“EATON.COUNTY. T e

A | -Thev _2‘(‘)»09"Mvi'chigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing 'Bﬁildinés is amended t0 add a new
. subsection 113.6 to read as follows: - S e e T

' Seétibn R113.6 Schedule of Fines
o A.'Genérql; Fines for Muhicipal‘Civi‘:l'_Infmcﬁon Citations. .

1. A person, corporation or firm who violates any provisions of any subsection of

~ the 2009 Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings and is found

responsible at the District Court for a municipal civil infraction citation, shall.

~ pay:civil fines of not less than $100.00 nor more than $500.00, plus costs and
“other sanctions, for eachinfraction. -~

- 2. Repeat offenses shall be subject fo increased fines as set forth below. As
used in this subsection, "repeat offense”, means a second (or any subsequent)
municipal- civil infraction of the same requirement or provision of a subsection -

~ of the 2009 Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings committed
by a corporation, person or firm within any 36 month period and, for which
the person admits responsibility or is determined to be responsible. The
increased fine for a repeat offense under any subsection shall be as follows:

(i) The fine for any offense that is a repeat offense shall be no less
than $200 plus costs and other sanctions. oo s




~ (i) The fine for ony offense that is a second repeat offense shall be no
less than $350 plus cost and other sanctions.

(m) The fine for any offense that is a third or subsequent repea’r offense
shall be no less 1han $500 plus costs ond other sanctions.

B. Fines for Violahon Nohces

A person, corporaflon or firm who; as a result-of violating any provusnon of a
- subsection of the 2009 Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings that
_receives a. municipal civil infraction violation notice, upon a determination of
responsibility thereon, shall pay an initial civil fine at the Eaton County Department
of Construchon Codes Civil Infraction’ Vlolahons Bureau of $100.00.

(i) In the case of another offense within 'rwo years of the date of the initial
infraction, the civil fme shall be §200 00. (This shall be known-as the second
offense)

(ii) In 'rhe case of another offense within two years of the date of the second
‘ offense the. civil fine shall be §3500 (This sholl be' known as the third.
offense). ,
(m) In the case of another offense within two years of fhe dafe of fhe Thlrd
" offense, the civil fine shall be $500.00. (This shall be known as the-fourth
g fense) All subsequem‘ offenses shall be subJect to a civil fine of $500 00.

SECTION 3. ADDITION ‘OF - SUBSECTION 113 7 TO THE 2009 MICHIGAN
: . REHABILITATION CODE FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS, AS AMENDED,
'AS ADOPTED -AND ENFORCEABLE THROUGH RULES OF THE
MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF - ENERGY, LABOR & ECONOMIC
. GROWTH, BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES AND ENFORCED BY

.EATON COUNTY '

The 2009 MlChlgdl'\ Rehablllfa'hon Code for Ex1shng Bunldmgs is amended to add a new .. |

" “subsection 113.7 to r'ead as follows

’ Section 113 7 Loca‘non of Violations Bureau

The Municipal Civil Infrachon Vlolahons Bureau, for dlsposmon of vuolcmon notices. issued
under the 2009 Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings, shall be located at the
Department of - Construction” Codes Office in the Eaton County Courfhouse 1045
Independence Boulevard Charlotte, MI 48813. » .




_SECTION 4. REPEALER

Al ordmances in confllcf are repealed only to 1he extent necessary ‘to give this ordmance
fuII force and effect ‘ .

~ SECTION 5. SEVERABILITY

" The various parfs sec'nons and clauses of 1h|s ordinance are hereby declared to be

~ severable. Should any part, clause, sentence, paragraph or section of this ordinance be -

found: invalid or unconstitutional for any.reason by any court of competent Jurlsd1ct|on any
such decnsxon shall no’r affecf ‘the valudn‘y of fhe remamder of this ordmance .

| sscnon 6 SAVINGS CLAUSE
- Al proceedmgs pending and all rughts and llabulrhes exnshng acqulred or incurred af the time . -

~ this ordinance takes effect are saved and may be consummafed accordmg to ’fhe Iaw in force
‘ when They were commenced dal A A

| SECTION 7. EFFECTIVE DATE |
' "_The provusrons of thls ordmance are ordered to take effect ofter publlcahon '
I Fran Fuller, Eaton Coum‘y Clerk cer’nfy that 'rhls ordmance was adop'red by fhe |

fa’fon Counfy Board of Commisswners and publlshed on_

Jm Ju&»_,,

Fran Fuller, Eaton Coun‘ry Clerk




